ORDINANCE NO. 2013-05

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF MONROVIA, CALIFORNIA,
AMENDING TITLE 15 OF THE MONROVIA MUNICIPAL CODE, ADOPTING BY
REFERENCE THE 2013 EDITION OF THE CALIFORNIA BUILDING STANDARDS CODE..
KNOWN AS THE CALIFORNIA CODE OF REGULATIONS (PART 2 OF TITLE 24), EXCEPT
CHAPTER 27 (ELECTRICAL), CHAPTER 28 (MECHANICAL), CHAPTER 29 (PLUMBING),
AND APPENDICES A-H AND J-M; THE 2013 CALIFORNIA HISTORICAL BUILDING CODE
(PART 8 OF TITLE 24); THE 2013 CALIFORNIA EXISTING BUILDING CODE (PART 10 OF
TITLE 21), BASED ON THE 2012 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE VOLUMES | AND II;
THE 2013 CALIFORNIA RESIDENTIAL CODE (PART 2.5 OF TITLE 24), EXCEPT
APPENDICES A-Q, BASED ON THE 2012 INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE; THE
2013 CALIFORNIA GREEN BUILDING STANDARDS CODE, CHAPTER 4 AND CHAPTER §
MANDATORY MEASURES ONLY (CALGREEN) (PART 11 OF TITLE 24); THE 2013
CALIFORNIA PLUMBING CODE (PART 5 OF TITLE 24), BASED ON THE 2012 UNIFORM
PLUMBING CODE; THE 2013 CALIFORNIA MECHANICAL CODE (PART 4 OF TITLE 24),
BASED ON THE 2012 UNIFORM MECHANICAL CODE; THE 2013 CALIFORNIA ENERGY
CODE (PART 6 OF TITLE 24); THE 2013 CALIFORNIA ELECTRICAL CODE (PART 3 OF
TITLE 24), BASED ON THE 2011 NATIONAL ELECTRICAL CODE; THE 2013 CALIFORNIA
FIRE CODE (PART 9 OF TITLE 24), BASED ON THE 2012 INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE;
AND READOPTING THE 1997 EDITION OF THE UNIFORM HOUSING CODE, THE 1997
EDITION OF THE ADMINISTRATIVE CODE, THE 2000 EDITION OF THE SOLAR ENERGY
CODE, THE 1997 EDITION OF THE BUILDING SECURITY CODE, ADOPTING CERTAIN
AMENDMENTS, ADDITIONS, AND DELETIONS TO THE FOREGOING UNIFORM CODES,
RE-ADOPTING PENALTIES FOR VIOLATIONS THEREOF, AND MAKING FINDINGS

ACCORDING TO LAW
THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF MONROVIA DOES ORDAIN AS FOLLOWS

SECTION 1. Chapter 15.04 (“Codes Adopted”) of the Monrovia Municipal Code is
hereby amended as follows. Existing Monrovia Municipal Code Sections un-changed by this
Ordinance shall remain in effect, with the exception of existing references to previous editions of
the codes referenced, which are hereby repealed and replaced with the editions adopted by

reference in this Ordinance:
“Chapter 15.04

CODES ADOPTED

§ 15.04.010 Adoption.

The following codes are hereby adopted by reference, with the exception of the additions,
deletions and amendments set forth in this chapter. With the Existing references to prior

editions of the codes are hereby repealed:

A) Building Code.

(1) Adoption. Except as hereinafter provided, and except Chapter 27 (electrical),
Chapter 28 (mechanical), Chapter 29 (plumbing), and appendices A-H and J-M, the California
Building Code, 2013 Edition (Cal. Code of Regulations Title 24, Part 2), is hereby adopted by
reference as the Building Code of the City of Monrovia. A copy of the Building Code of the City
shall be maintained in the office of the City Clerk, and shall be made available for public




inspection while the code is in force.

(B) Mechanical Code.

4} Adoption. Except as hereinafter provided, the California Mechanical Code, 2013
Edition (Cal. Code of Regulations Title 24, Part 4), is hereby adopted by reference as the
Mechanical Code of the City of Monrovia. A copy of the Mechanical Code of the City shall be
maintained in the office of the City Clerk, and shall be made available for public inspection while
the code is in force.

(© Plumbing Code.

(1) Adoption. Except as hereinafter provided, the California Plumbing Code, 2013
Edition (Cal. Code of Regulations, Title 24, Part 5), is hereby adopted by reference as the
Plumbing Code of the city of Monrovia. A copy of the Plumbing Code of the City shall be
maintained in the office of the City Clerk, and shall be made available for public inspection while
the code is in force.

(D) Electrical Code.

(1) Adoption. Except as hereinafter provided, the 2013 California Electrical Code
(Part 3, Title 24, Cal. Code of Regulations) is hereby adopted by reference and incorporated
herein as though set forth in full as the Electrical Code of the City of Monrovia. A copy of the
Electrical Code of the City shall be maintained in the office of the City Clerk, and shall be made
available for public inspection while the code is in force.




(1) Adoption. Except as hereinafter provided, the California Building-Gonservation
Existing Building Code, 2013 Edition (Cal. Code of Regulations Title 24, Part 10), is hereby

adopted by reference as the California Existing Building Code of the City of Monrovia. A copy of
the California Existing Building Code of the City shall be maintained in the office of the City
Clerk, and shall be made available for public inspection while the code is in force. o

(F) Administrative Code.

(1) Adoption. Except as hereinafter provided, the Uniform Administrative Code,
1997 Edition, is hereby adopted by reference as the Administrative Code of the City of
Monrovia. A copy of the Administrative Code of the City shall be maintained in the office of the
City Clerk, and shall be made available for public inspection while the code is in force.

(G)  Housing Code.

)] Adoption. Except as hereinafter provided, the Uniform Housing Code, 1997
Edition is hereby adopted by reference as the Housing Code of the City of Monrovia. A copy of
the Housing Code of the City shall be maintained in the office of the City Clerk, and shall be
made available for public inspection while the code is in force.

(H) Building Security Code.

1) Adoption. Except as hereinafter provided, the Uniform Building Security Code,
1997 Edition, is hereby adopted by reference as the Building Security Code of the City of
Monrovia. A copy of the Building Security Code of the City shall be maintained in the office of
the City Clerk, and shall be made available for public inspection while the code is in force.




(I)Solar Energy Code.

1) Adoption. Except as hereinafter provided, Uniform Solar Energy Code, 2000
Edition, is hereby adopted by reference as the Solar Energy Code of the City of Monrovia. A
copy of the Solar Energy Code of the City shall be maintained in the office of the City Clerk, and
shall be made available for public inspection while the code is in force.

(J) California Residential Code.

4} Adoption. Except as hereinafter provided, and except appendces A-Q, the
California Residential Code, 2010 Edition (Cal. Code of Regulations Title 24, Part 2.5), is hereby
adopted by reference as the California Residential Code of the City of Monrovia. A copy of the
California Residential Code of the City shall be maintained in the office of the City Clerk, and
shall be made available for public inspection while the code is in force.

(K) California Green Building Standards Code.

@) Adoption. Except as hereinafter provided, the California Green Building
Standards Code, 2010 Edition (Cal. Code of Regulations Title 24, Part 2.5), is hereby adopted
by reference as the California Green Building Standards Code of the City of Monrovia. A copy of
the California Green Building Standards Code of the City shall be maintained in the office of the
City Clerk, and shail be made available for public inspection while the code is in force.

(L) California Historical Building Code

1 Adoption. Except as hereinafter provided, the California Historical Building Code,
2013 Edition (Cal. Code of Regulations Title 24, Part 8), is hereby adopted by reference as the
California Historical Building Code of the City of Monrovia. A copy of the California Historical
Building Code of the City shall be maintained in the office of the City Clerk, and shall be made
available for public inspection while the code is in force.




(M)  California Energy Code

) Adoption. Except as hereinafter provided, the California Energy Code 2013
Edition (California Code of Regulations Title 24, Part 6) is hereby adopted by reference as the
California Energy Code of the City of Monrovia. A copy of the California Energy Code of the City
shall be maintained in the office of the City Clerk, and shall be made available for public
inspection while the code is in force.”

“§ 15.04.020 SUBSTITUTION OF TERMS.

The following word and phrase substitutions are made in all codes adopted in § 15.04.010
wherever they appear:

For the word or phrase: Substitute:

City of City of Monrovia
governing body City Council
jurisdiction City of Monrovia
Board of Appeals Planning Commission”
“§ 15.04.025 PENALTIES.

(A) Any violation of any provision of this Chapter or any Code adopted herein by reference
shall constitute a misdemeanor and shall be punishable by a fine not to exceed one thousand
dollars ($1,000) or by imprisonment for a period not to exceed six (6) months, or by both such
fine and imprisonment, unless prosecuted as an infraction by the City Prosecutor. Each and
every day such a violation exists shall constitute a separate and distinct violation of this
Ordinance.

(B) The violation of any of the provisions of this Ordinance or any Code adopted herein by
reference shall constitute a public nuisance and may be abated by the City through civil process
by means of restraining order, preliminary or permanent injunction or in any other manner
provided by this Code or other applicable law for the abatement of such nuisances.

(C) If designated in this Code, a violation of this Chapter may be prosecuted and subject to
fine by way of administrative citation.




BUILDING CODE AMENDMENTS

“§ 15.04.225 SECTION 701A.1 AMENDED-SCOPE.

Section 701A.1 is amended to read as follows: o

701A.1 Scope. This chapter applies to building materials, systems and/or assemblies used in ‘
the exterior design and construction of new buildings and additions to existing buildings located
within the Wildland-Urban Interface Fire Area.”
Section 701A.3 is amended to read as follows:

701A.3 Application. New buildings located in the Wildland-Urban Interface Area shall comply
with the provisions of this chapter.

EXCEPTION:
1. Buildings of an accessory character classified as a Group U occupancy of any size

located at least 50 feet from a Group R-3 structure.

Additions to existing buildings and/or construction of the existing structure located in the
Wildland-Urban Interface Area shall comply with the provisions of this chapter.

EXCEPTION:
1. Additions made during the previous 60 months to the existing structure less than 10

percent of the original area.

The construction requirements of the existing structure located in the Wildland-Urban Interface
Area is based on the following:

1. Over 10% but less than 50% addition. The construction of the existing structure or
building being added to may be left in place providing the cumulative area of additions
made during the previous 60 months to the existing structure is over 10 percent but less
than 50 percent of the original area.

2. 50% or more addition. The construction of the existing structure or building being
added to shall be made to comply with the provisions of this chapter when the
cumulative area of additions made during the previous 60 months to the existing
structure is 50 percent or more of the original area.”

“§ 15.04.240 CHAPTER 8-AMENDED - FIRE-EXTINGUISHING SYSTEMS: SECTION 903.2
AMENDED - AUTOMATIC SPRINKLER SYSTEMS.

Section 903.2 of the Building Code is hereby amended to read as follows:

1. In all new buildings regardless of the type of construction or occupancy.

EXCEPTIONS:

A) Detached Group U occupancies, providing the floor area does not exceed 1000 square feet.
B) Other minor buildings and/or occupancies as approved by the Fire Chief.

2. In existing buildings with new occupancies as required by other sections of the Fire Code.”




“§ 15.04.245 SECTION 903.2.18 AMENDED—GROUP U PRIVATE GARAGES AND
CARPORTS ACCESSORY TO GROUP R-3 OCCUPANCIES.

Section 903.2.18 of the Building Code is hereby amended to read as follows:

Carports with habitable space above, detached private garages over 1000 square feet in area,
and attached private garages shall be protected by fire sprinklers in accordance with this
section. These areas shall have a design density of an Ordinary Hazard Group 1 occupancy
with a design area of two (2) heads. Quick-response intermediate temperature commercial type
heads shall be used.”

“§ 15.04.250 RESERVED: SECTION 903.3.1.2 AMENDED - NFPA 13R SPRINKLER
SYSTEM.

Section 903.3.1.2 of the Building Code is hereby amended to read as follows:

Where allowed in buildings of Group R, up to and including buildings four stories in height,
automatic sprinkler systems shall be installed throughout in accordance with NFPA 13R with the
following additions:

(a) Attics shall be fully sprinklered with quick-response intermediate temperature heads.

(b) Private garages shall be sprinklered and shall have a design density of an Ordinary Hazard
Group 1 occupancy with a design area of two (2) heads. Quick-response intermediate
temperature commercial type heads shall be used for the garage area.”

“§ 15.04.255 SECTION 903.3.1.3 AMENDED - NFPA 13D SPRINKLER SYSTEM.

Section 903.3.1.3 of the Building Code is hereby amended to read as follows:
Where allowed in buildings of Group R, automatic sprinkler systems shall be installed
throughout in accordance with NFPA 13D with the following additions:

(a) Attics containing forced air units shall have one or more quick-response intermediate
temperature sprinkler heads adjacent to each unit.

(b) Private garages shall be sprinklered and shall have a design density of an Ordinary Hazard
Group 1 occupancy with a design area of two (2) heads. Quick-response intermediate
temperature commercial type heads shall be used for the garage area.

(c) Attics and basements used for storage purposes shall be fully sprinklered with residential
type heads.

(d) A single exterior bell activated by the waterflow switch shall be provided at an approved
location.”

“§ 15.04.260 RESERVED- Section 1507.1 of the Building Code is amended to read as
follows:

(A) The first paragraph of Section 1507.1 is revised by adding a new second sentence to read
as follows:

No wood roof covering or roof covering material containing wood or wood products, whether
treated or untreated, may be installed.




EXCEPTION: Additions to Group R, Division 3 Occupancies which have existing wood roof
coverings may be covered with matching materials, provided the new material qualifies as a
Class A or B roof covering.

{G) (B) Subsection 1505.5 is deleted entirety.
{B) (C) Table 15 amended by referencing a new Footnote 1 at the table title with said footnote to
read as follows:

1. No wood roof covering or roof covering material containing wood or wood products, whether
treated or untreated, may be installed. See Section 1507.1 for exception.

1507.3.1 Deck requirements. Concrete and clay tile shall be instailed only over solid sheathing
or spaced structural sheathing boards.

TABLE 1507.3.7
CLAY AND CONCRETE TILE ATTACHMENT ¢

GENERAL - CLAY OR CONCRETE ROOF TILE

Maxin!um Mean
basic roof
wind height Roof slope up to <3:12 Roof slope 3:12 and over
speed | " roat)
(mph)
85 0-60 Minimum slope: 2.5:12 .
. Two fasteners per tile.
100 0-40 Two fasteners per tile.
The head of all tiles shall be nailed. The nose of all eave tiles shall be
100 > 40 - 60 fastened with approved clips. All rake tiles shall be nailed with two
nails. The nose of all ridge, hip and rake tiles shall be set in a bead of
roofer’'s mastic.
110 0-60 The fastening system shall resist the wind forces in Section 1609.5.2.
120 0-60 The fastening system shall resist the wind forces in Section 1609.5.2.
130 0-60 The fastening system shall resist the wind forces in Section 1609.5.2.
All >60 The fastening system shall resist the wind forces in Section 1609.5.2.
INTERLOCKING CLAY OR CONCRETE ROOF TILE WITH PROJECTING ANCHOR LUGS **
(Installations on solid sheathing with battens)
Maximum Mean )
basic roof RoostoP e up to Roof slope 5:12<12:12 Roof slope 12:12
p , <5:12 and over
wind height




speed (feet)
(mph)
One fastener
- One fastener per tile. required for every
Tiles with installed tile. Tiles with
85 0-60 Minimum slope is weight less than 9 installed weight less
4:12 Ibs/sq. ft. require a than 9 Ibs./sq. ft.
minimum of one require a minimum
fastener per tile of one fastener per
tile.
The head of all tiles shall be nailed. The nose of all eave tiles shall be
100 > 40 - 60 fastened with approved clips. All rake tiles shall be nailed with two
nails The nose of all ridge, hip and rake tiles shall be set in a bead of
roofers mastic.
110 0-60 The fastening system shall resist the wind forces in Section 1609.5.2.

INTERLOCKING CLAY OR CONCRETE ROOF TILE WITH PROJECTING ANCHOR LUGS
(Installations on solid sheathing without battens)

Maximum

. Mean
‘;:‘:’: roof Minimum All roof slopes 4 units vertical in 12 units horizontal
speed height Maximum slope 7 units vertical in 12 units horizontal
(mph) (feet)
120 0-60 The fastening system shall resist the wind forces in Section 1609.5.2.
130 0-60 The fastening system shall resist the wind forces in Section 1609.5.2.
All > 60 The fastening system shall resist the wind forces in Section 1609.5.2
85 0-60 One fastener per tile.
100 0-40 One fastener per tile.
The head of all tiles shall be nailed. The nose of all eave tiles shall be
100 >40 - 60 fastened with approved clips. All rake tiles shall be nailed with two
nails The nose of all ridge, hip and rake tiles shall be set in a bead of
roofer’s mastic.
110 0-60 The fastening system shall resist the wind forces in Section 1609.5.2.
120 0-60 The fastening system shall resist the wind forces in Section 1609.5.2.
130 0-60 The fastening system shall resist the wind forces in Section 1609.5.2.
All > 60 The fastening system shall resist the wind forces in Section 1609.5.2.

For SI: 1 inch = 25.4 mm, 1 foot = 304.8 mm, 1 mile per hour = 0.447 m/s, 1 pound per square

foot = 4.882 kg/m2.
a. Minimum fastener size. Hot dipped galvanized ring shank or other corrosion-resistant nails
not less than No. 11 gage with 5/16-inch head. Fasteners shall be long enough to penetrate into
the sheathing 0.75 inch or through the thickness of the sheathing, whichever is less. Attaching
wire for clay and concrete tile shall not be smaller than 0.083 inch and shall be copper, brass or
stainless steel.
b. Snow areas. A minimum of two fasteners per tile are required or battens and one fastener.




c. Roof slopes greater than 24:12. The nose of all tiles shall be securely fastened.

d. Horizontal battens. Battens shall be not less than 1inch by 2 inch nominal. Provisions shall be
made for drainage by a minimum of 1/8-inch riser at each nail or by 4-foot-long battens with at
least a 0.5-inch separation between battens. Horizontal battens are required for slopes over
7:12. o

e. Perimeter fastening areas include three tile courses but not less than 36 inches from either
side of hips or ridges and edges of eaves and gable rakes.

“§ 15.04.270 CHAPTER 16 AMENDED STRUCTURAL DESIGN.

2013 16-01. Section 1613.6 is added to Chapter 16 of the 2013 Edition of the California
Building Code to read as follows:

1613.6 ASCE 7, 12.12.3 Modify ASCE 7 Equation 12.12-1 of Section 12.12.3 to read as
follows:

5, = SaOm (12.12-1)
= -

2013 16-02. Section 1613.7 is added to Chapter 16 of the 2013 Edition of the California
Building Code to read as follows:

1613.7 ASCE 7, 12.2.3.1, Exception 3. Modify ASCE 7 Section 12.2.3.1 Exception 3 to read as
follows:

3. Detached one- and two-family dwellings up to two stories in_height of light frame
construction.

2013 16-03. Section 1613.8 is added to Chapter 16 of the 2013 Edition of the California Building
Code to read as follows:

1613.8 ASCE 7, Section 12.11.2.2.3. Modify ASCE 7, Section 12.11.2.2.3 to read as follows:

12.11.2.2.3 Wood Diaphragms. In wood diaphragms, the continuous ties shall be in
addition to the diaphragm sheathing. Anchorage shall not be accomplished by use of toe
nails or nails subject to withdrawal nor shall wood ledgers or framing be used in cross-grain
bending or cross-grain tension. The diaphragm sheathing shall not be considered effective
as providing ties or struts required by this section.

For structures assigned to Seismic Design Category D. E or F, wood diaphragms
supporting concrete or masonry walls shall comply with the following:

1. The spacing of continuous ties shall not exceed 40 feet. Added chords of diaphragms
may be used to form sub diaphragms to transmit the anchorage forces to the main
continuous crossties.

2. The maximum diaphragm shear used to determine the depth of the sub diaphragm shall
not exceed 75% of the maximum diaphragm shear.

2013 16-04. Section 1613.9 is added to Chapter 16 of the 2013 Edition of the California
Building Code to read as follows:




1613.9 Seismic Design Provisions for Hillside Buildings.

1613.9.1 Purpose. The purpose of this section is to establish minimum regulations for the
design and construction of new buildings and additions to existing buildings when
constructing such buildings on or into slopes steeper than one unit vertical in three units
horizontal (33.3%). These requlations establish _minimum standards for seismic force
resistance to reduce the risk of injury or loss of life in the event of earthquakes.

1613.9.2 Scope. The provisions of this section shall apply to the design of the lateral-force-
resisting system for hillside buildings at and below the base level diaphragm. The design of
the_lateral-force-resisting system above the base level diaphragm shall be in accordance

with the provisions for seismic and wind design as required elsewhere in this division.

Exception: Non-habitable accessory buildings and decks not supporting or supported
from the main building are exempt from these regulations.

1613.9.3 Definitions. For the purposes of this section certain terms are defined as follows:

BASE LEVEL DIAPHRAGM is the floor at, or closest to, the top of the highest level of
the foundation.

DIAPHRAGM ANCHORS are assemblies that connect a diaphragm to the adjacent
foundation at the uphill diaphragm edge.

DOWNHILL DIRECTION is the descending direction of the slope approximately
perpendicular to the slope contours.

FOUNDATION is concrete or masonry which supports a building, including footings,
stem walls, retaining walls, and grade beams.

FOUNDATION EXTENDING IN THE DOWNHILL DIRECTION is a foundation running
downhill and approximately perpendicular to the uphill foundation.

HILLSIDE BUILDING is any building or portion thereof constructed on or into a slope
steeper than one unit vertical in three units horizontal (33.3%). If only a portion of the
building is supported on or into the slope, these regulations apply to the entire building.

PRIMARY ANCHORS are diaphragm anchors designed for and providing a direct
connection as described in Sections 1613.9.5 and 1613.9.7.3 between the diaphragm
and the uphill foundation.

SECONDARY ANCHORS are diaphragm anchors designed for and providing a
redundant diaphragm to foundation connection, as described in Sections 1613.9.6 and

1613.9.7.4.

UPHILL DIAPHRAGM EDGE is the edge of the diaphragm adjacent and closest to the
highest ground level at the perimeter of the diaphragm.

UPHILL FOUNDATION is the foundation parallel and closest to the uphill diaphragm
edge.

1613.9.4 Analysis and Design.




1613.9.4.1 General. Every hiliside building within the scope of this section shall be
analyzed, designed, and constructed in accordance with the provisions of this division.
When the code-prescribed wind design produces greater effects, the wind design shall
.. govern, but detailing requirements and limitations prescribed in this and referenced
sections shall be followed.
1613.9.4.2 Base Level Diaphragm-Downhill Direction. The following provisions shall
apply to the seismic analysis and design of the connections for the base level diaphragm
in the downhill direction.

1613.9.4.2.1 Base for Lateral Force Design Defined. For seismic forces acting in the
downhill direction, the base of the building shall be the floor at or closest to the top of the

highest level of the foundation.

1613.9.4.2.2 Base Shear. In developing the base shear for seismic design, the
response modification coefficient (R) shall not exceed 5 for bearing wall and building
frame systems. The total base shear shall include the forces tributary to the base level
diaphragm including forces from the base level diaphragm.

1613.9.5 Base Shear Resistance-Primary Anchors.

1613.9.5.1 General. The base shear in the downhiil direction shall be resisted through
primary anchors from diaphragm struts provided in the base level diaphragm to the
foundation.

1613.9.5.2 Location of Primary Anchors. A primary anchor and diaphragm strut shall
be provided in line with each foundation extending in the downhill direction. Primary
anchors and diaphragm struts shall also be provided where interior vertical lateral-force-
resisting elements occur _above and in_contact with the base level diaphragm. The
spacing of primary anchors and diaphragm struts or collectors shall in no case exceed
30 feet (9144 mm).

1613.9.5.3 Design of Primary Anchors and Diaphragm Struts. Primary anchors and

diaphragm_struts shall be designed in accordance with the requirements of Section
1613.9.8.

1613.9.5.4 Limitations. The following laterai-force-resisting elements shall not be
designed to resist seismic forces below the base level diaphragm in the downhill
direction:

1. Wood structural panel wall sheathing,
2. Cement plaster and lath,

3. Gypsum wallboard, and

4. Tension only braced frames.

Braced frames designed in accordance with the requirements of Section 2205.2.2
may be used to transfer forces from the primary anchors and diaphragm struts to the
foundation provided lateral forces do not induce flexural stresses in any member of
the frame or in the diaphragm struts. Deflections of frames shall account for the
variation in slope of diagonal members when the frame is not rectanquilar.

1613.9.6. Base Shear Resistance-Secondary Anchors.




1613.9.6.1 General. In addition to the primary anchors required by Section 1613.9.5, the
base shear in the downhill direction shall be resisted through secondary anchors in the

uphill foundation connected to diaphragm struts in the base level diaphragm.

Exception: Secondary anchors are not required where foundations extending in the
downhill direction spaced at not more than 30 feet (9144 mm) on center extend up to
and are directly connected to the base level diaphragm for at least 70% of the
diaphragm depth.

1613.9.6.2 Secondary Anchor Capacity and Spacing. Secondary anchors at the base
level diaphragm shall be designed for a minimum force equal to the base shear,
including forces tributary to the base level diaphragm, but not less than 600 pounds per
lineal foot (8.76 kN/m). The secondary anchors shall be uniformly distributed along the
uphill diaphragm edge and shall be spaced a_maximum of four feet (1219 mm) on
center.

1613.9.6.3 Design. Secondary anchors and diaphragm struts shall be designed in
accordance with Section 1613.9.8.

1613.9.7 Diaphragms Below the Base Level-Downhill Direction. The following provisions
shall apply to the lateral analysis and design of the connections for all diaphragms below the
base level diaphragm in the downhill direction.

1613.9.7.1 Diaphragm Defined. Every floor level below the base level diaphragm shall
be designed as a diaphragm.

1613.9.7.2 Design Force. Each diaphragm below the base level diaphragm shall be
designed for all tributary loads at that level using a minimum seismic force factor not less
than the base shear coefficient.

1613.9.7.3 Design Force Resistance-Primary Anchors. The design force described in
Section 1613.9.7.2 shall be resisted through primary anchors from diaphragm_struts
provided in each diaphragm to the foundation. Primary anchors shall be provided and
designed in accordance with the requirements and limitations of Section 1613.9.5.

1613.9.7.4 Design Force Resistance-Secondary Anchors.

1613.9.7.4.1 General. In addition to the primary anchors required in Section 1613.9.7.3,
the design force in the downhill direction shall be resisted through secondary anchors in
the uphill foundation connected to diaphragm struts in each diaphragm below the base
level.

Exception: Secondary anchors are not required where foundations extending in the
downhill direction, spaced at not more than 30 feet (3144 mm) on center, extend up
to and are directly connected to each diaphragm below the base level for at least
70% of the diaphragm depth.

1613.9.7.4.2 Secondary Anchor Capacity. Secondary anchors at each diaphragm
below the base level diaphragm shall be designed for a minimum force equal to the
design force but not less than 300 pounds per lineal foot (4.38 kN/m). The secondary
anchors_shall be uniformly distributed along the uphill diaphragm edge and shall be




spaced a maximum of four feet (1219 mm) on center.

1613.9.7.4.3 Design. Secondary anchors and diaphragm struts shall be designed in

accordance with Section 1613.9.8.

<o

1613.9.8 Primary and Secondary Anchorage and Diaphragm Strut Design. Primary and
secondary anchors and diaphragm struts shall be designed in accordance with the following

provisions:

1.

Fasteners. All bolted fasteners used to develop connections to wood members shall

be provided with square plate washers at all bolt heads and nuts. Washers shall be
minimum 0.229 inch by 3 inches by 3 inches (5.82 mm by 76 mm by 76 mm) in size.
Nuts shall be tightened to finger tight plus one half (1/2) wrench turn prior to covering

the framing.

Fastening. The diaphragm to foundation anchorage shall not be accomplished by the

use of toenailing, nails subject to withdrawal, or wood in_cross-grain _bending or
cross-grain tension.

Size of Wood Members. Wood diaphragm struts collectors, and other wood

members connected to primary anchors shall not be less than three-inch (76 mm)
nominal width. The effects of eccentricity on wood members shall be evaluated as
required per Item 9.

Design. Primary and secondary anchorage, including diaphragm struts, splices, and

collectors shall be designed for 125% of the tributary force.

Allowable Stress Increase. The one-third allowable stress increase permitted under

Section 1605.3.2 shall not be taken when the working (allowable) stress design
method is used.

Steel Element of Structural Wall Anchorage System. The strength design forces for

steel elements of the structural wall anchorage system, with the exception of anchor
bolts and reinforcing steel, shall be increased by 1.4 times the forces otherwise

required.

Primary Anchors. The load path for primary anchors and diaphragm struts shall be

fully developed into the diaphragm and into the foundation. The foundation must be
shown to be adequate to resist the concentrated loads from the primary anchors.

Secondary Anchors. The load path for secondary anchors and diaphragm struts shall

be fully developed in the diaphragm but need not be developed beyond the
connection to the foundation.

Symmetry. All lateral force foundation anchorage and diaphragm strut connections

10.

shall be symmetrical. Eccentric connections may be permitted when demonstrated
by calculation or tests that all components of force have been provided for in the
structural analysis or tests.

Wood Ledgers. Wood ledgers shall not be used to resist cross-grain bending or

cross-grain tension.




1613.9.9 Lateral-Force-Resisting Elements Normal to the Downhill Direction.

1613.9.9.1 General. In the direction normal to the downhill direction, lateral-force-
resisting elements shall be designed in accordance with the requirements of this section.

1613.9.9.2 Base Shear. In developing the base shear for seismic design, the response
modification _coefficient (R) shall not exceed 5 for bearing wall and building frame

systems.

1613.9.9.3 Vertical Distribution of Seismic Forces. For seismic forces acting normal
to the downhill direction the distribution of seismic forces over the height of the building
using Section 12.8.3 of ASCE 7 shall be determined using the height measured from the
top of the lowest level of the building foundation.

1613.9.9.4 Drift Limitations. The story drift below the base level diaphragm shall not
exceed 0.007 times the story height at strength design force level. The total drift from the
base level diaphragm to the top of the foundation shall not exceed 3/4 inch (19 mm).
Where the story height or the height from the base level diaphragm to the top of the
foundation varies because of a stepped footing or story offset, the height shall be
measured from the average height of the top of the foundation. The story drift shall not
be reduced by the effect of horizontal diaphragm stiffness.

1613.9.9.5 Distribution of Lateral Forces.

1613.9.9.5.1 General. The design lateral force shall be distributed to lateral-force-
resisting elements of varying heights in _accordance with the stiffness of each
individual element.

1613.9.9.5.2 Wood Structural Panel Sheathed Walls. The stiffness of a stepped
wood structural panel shear wall may be determined by dividing the wall into
adjacent rectanguiar elements, subject to the same top of wall deflection. Deflections
of shear walls may be estimated by AF&PA SDPWS Section 4.3.2. Sheathing and
fastening requirements for the stiffest section shall be used for the entire wall. Each
section of wall shall be anchored for shear and uplift at each step. The minimum
horizontal length of a step shall be eight feet (2438 mm) and the maximum vertical
height of a step shall be two feet, eight inches (813 mm).

1613.9.9.5.3 Reinforced Concrete or Masonry Shear Walls. Reinforced concrete
or masonry shear walls shall have forces distributed in proportion to the rigidity of
each section of the wall.

1613.9.9.6 Limitations. The following lateral force-resisting-elements shall not be
designed to resist lateral forces below the base level diaphragm in the direction normal
to the downhill direction:

1. Cement plaster and Iath,
2. Gypsum wallboard, and
3. Tension-only braced frames.

Braced frames designed in accordance with the requirements of Section 2205.2.2 of
this Code may be designed as lateral-force-resisting elements in the direction normal
to the downhill direction, provided lateral forces do not induce flexural stresses in any




member of the frame. Deflections of frames shall account for the variation in slope of
diagonal members when the frame is not rectangular.

1613.9.10 Specific Design Provisions.

1613.9.10.1 Footings and Grade Beams. All footings and grade beams shall comply
with the following:

1. Grade beams shall extend at least 12 inches (305 mm) below the lowest
adjacent grade and provide a minimum 24-inch (610 mm) distance horizontally
from the bottom outside face of the grade beam to the face of the descending

slope.

2. Continuous footings shall be reinforced with at least two No. 4 reinforcing bars at
the top and two No. 4 reinforcing bars at the bottom.

3. All main footing and grade beam reinforcement steel shall be bent into the
intersecting footing and fully developed around each corner and intersection.

4. All concrete stem walls shall extend from the foundation and reinforced as
required for concrete or masonry walls.

1613.9.10.2 Protection Against Decay and Termites. All wood to earth separation
shall comply with the following:

1. Where a footing or grade beam extends across a descending slope, the stem
wall, grade beam, or footing shall extend up to a minimum 18 inches (457 mm)
above the highest adjacent grade.

Exception: At paved garage and doorway entrances to the building, the stem
wall need only extend to the finished concrete slab, provided the wood

framing is protected with a moisture proof barrier.

2. Wood ledgers supporting a vertical load of more than 100 pounds per lineal foot
(1.46 kN/m) and located within 48 inches (1219 mm) of adjacent grade are
prohibited. Galvanized steel ledgers and anchor bolts, with or without wood
nailers, or treated or decay resistant sill plates supported on a concrete or
masonry seat, may be used.

1613.9.10.3 Sill Plates. All sill plates and anchorage shall comply with the following:

1. All wood framed walls, including nonbearing walls, when resting on a footing,
foundation, or grade beam stem wall, shall be supported on wood sill plates
bearing on a level surface.

2. Power-driven fasteners shall not be used to anchor sill plates except at interior
nonbearing walls not designed as shear walls.

1613.9.10.4 Column Base Plate Anchorage. The base of isolated wood posts (not
framed into a stud wall) supporting a vertical load of 4,000 pounds (17.8 kN) or more and
the base plate for a steel column shall comply with the following:




1. When the post or column is supported on a pedestal extending above the top of
a footing or grade beam, the pedestal shall be designed and reinforced as
required for concrete or masonry columns. The pedestal shall be reinforced with
a_minimum of four No. 4 bars extending to the bottom of the footing or grade
beam. The top of exterior pedestals shall be sloped for positive drainage.

2. The base plate anchor bolts or the embedded portion of the post base, and the
vertical reinforcing bars for the pedestal, shall be confined with two No. 4 or three
No. 3 ties within the top five inches (127 mm) of the concrete or masonry
pedestal. The base plate anchor bolts shall be embedded a minimum of 20 bolt
diameters into the concrete or masonry pedestal. The base plate anchor bolts
and post bases shall be galvanized and each anchor bolt shall have at least two
galvanized nuts above the base plate.

1613.9.10.5 Steel Beam to Column Supports. All steel beam to column supports shall
be positively braced in each direction. Steel beams shall have stiffener plates installed
on each side of the beam web at the column. The stiffener plates shall be welded to
each beam flange and the beam web. Each brace connection or structural member shall
consist of at least two 5/8 inch (15.9 mm) diameter machine bolts.

2013 16-05. Section 1613.10 is added to Chapter 16 of the 2013 Edition of the California
Building Code to read as follows:

1613.10 Suspended Ceilings. Minimum design and installation standards for suspended
ceilings shall be determined in accordance with the requirements of Section 2506.2.1 of this

Code and this section.

1613.10.1 Scope. This part contains special requirements for suspended ceilings and
lighting systems. Provisions of Section 13.5.6 of ASCE 7-10 shall apply except as modified
herein.

1613.10.2 General. The suspended ceilings and lighting systems shall be limited to 6 feet
(1828 mm) below the structural deck unless the lateral bracing is designed by a licensed
engineer or architect.

1613.10.3 Sprinkler Heads. All sprinkler heads (drops) except fire-resistance-rated
floor/ceiling or roof/ceiling assemblies, shall be designed to allow for free movement of the
sprinkler pipes with oversize rings, sleeves or adaptors through the ceiling tile. Sprinkler
heads and other penetrations shall have a 2 in. (50mm) oversize ring, sleeve, or adapter
through the ceiling tile to allow for free movement of at least 1 in. (25mm) in all horizontal
directions. Alternatively, a swing joint that can accommodate 1 in. (25 mm) of ceiling
movement in all horizontal directions is permitted to be provided at the top of the sprinkler
head extension.

Sprinkler heads penetrating fire-resistance-rated floor/ceiling or roof/ceiling assemblies shall
comply with Section 714 of this Code.

1613.10.4 Special Requirements for Means of Egress. Suspended ceiling assemblies
located along means of egress serving an occupant load of 30 or more shall comply with the
following provisions.

1613.10.4.1 General. Ceiling suspension systems shall be connected and braced with




vertical hangers attached directly to the structural deck along the means of egress
serving an_occupant load of 30 or more and at lobbies accessory to Group A
Occupancies. Spacing of vertical hangers shall not exceed 2 feet (610 mm) on center
along the entire length of the suspended ceiling assembly located along the means of
egress or at the lobby.

1613.10.4.2 Assembly Device. All lay-in panels shall be secured to the suspension
ceiling assembly with two hold-down clips_minimum for each tile within a 4-foot (1219
mm) radius of the exit lights and exit signs.

1613.10.4.3 Emergency Systems. Independent supports and braces shall be provided
for light fixtures required for exit_illumination. Power supply for exit illumination shall

comply with the requirements of Section 1006.3 of this Code.

1613.10.4.4 Supports for Appendage. Separate support from the structural deck shall
be provided for all appendages such as light fixtures, air diffusers, exit signs, and similar
elements.”

“§ 15.04.280 CHAPTER 17 AMENDED - STRUCTURAL TESTS AND SPECIAL
INSPECTIONS

2013 17-01. Section 1704.5 of the 2013 Edition of the California Building Code is amended to
read as follows:

1704.5 Structural Observations. Where required by the provisions of Section 1704.5.1 or

1704.5.2, the owner shall employ a-registered-design-professional-structural observer to perform
structural observations as defined in Section 1702._The structural observer shall be one of the

following individuals:

1. The reqistered design professional responsible for the structural design, or

2. A reqgistered design professional designated by the registered design professional
responsible for the structural design.

Prior to the commencement of observations, the structural observer shall submit to the
building official a written statement identifying the frequency and extent of structural
observations.

The owner or owner’s representative shall coordinate and call a preconstruction meeting
between the structural observer, contractors, affected subcontractors and special inspectors.
The structural observer shall preside over the meeting. The purpose of the meeting shall be to
identify the major structural elements and connections that affect the vertical and lateral load
resisting systems of the structure and to review scheduling of the required observations. A
record of the meeting shall be included in the report submitted to the building official.

Observed deficiencies shall be reported in writing to the owner or owner’'s representative,
special inspector, contractor and the building official. Upon the form prescribed by the building




official, the structural observer shall submit to the building official a written statement at each
significant_construction stage stating that the site visits have been made and identifying any
reported deficiencies which, to the best of the structural observer's knowledge, have not been
resolved. A final report by the structural observer which states that all observed deficiencies
have been resolved is required before acceptance of the work by the building official. -

2013 17-02. Section 1704.5.1 of the 2013 Edition of the California Building Code is amended to
read as follows:

41704.5.1 Structural observations for seismic resistance. Structural observations shall be
provided for those structures assigned to Seismic Design Category D, E or F, where one or
more of the following conditions exist:

1. The structure is classified as Risk Category Ill or IV in accordance with Table 1604.5.
2. The height of the structure is greater than 75 feet (22860 mm) above the base.
3. The structure is-assighed-to-Seismic-Design-Gategery-E—is classified as Risk Category |

or Il in accordance with Table 1604.5, and i
grade-plane-a lateral design is required for the structure or portion thereof.

Exception: One-story wood framed Group R-3 and Group U Occupancies less than
2.000 square feet in area, provided the adjacent grade is not steeper than 1 unit vertical
in 10 units horizontal (10% sloped), assigned to Seismic Design Category D.

4. When so designated by the registered design professional responsible for the structural
design.

5. When such observation is specifically required by the building official.

2013 17-03. Section 1705.3 of the 2013 Edition of the California Building Code is amended to
read as follows:

1705.3 Concrete Construction. The special inspections and verifications for concrete
construction shall be as required by this section and Table 1705.3.

Exceptions: Special inspection shall not be required for:

1. lIsolated spread concrete footings of buildings three stories or less above grade plane
that are fully supported on earth or rock, where the structural design of the footing is
based on a specified compressive strength, f'c, no greater than 2,500 pounds per square
inch (psi) (17.2 Mpa) regardless of the compressive strength specified in the
construction documents or used in the footing construction.

2. Continuous concrete footings supporting walls of buildings three stories or less in height
that are fully supported on earth or rock where:

2.1. The footings support walls of light-frame construction;
2.2. The footings are designed in accordance with Table 1805.4.2; or

2.3. The structural design of the footing is based on a specified compressive strength,



f'c, no greater than 2,500 pounds per square inch (psi) (17.2 Mpa), regardless of
the compressive strength specified in the construction documents or used in the
footing construction.

3. Nonstructural concrete slabs supported directly on the ground, including pre-stressed
slabs on grade, where the effective pre-stress in the concrete is less than 150 psi (1.03

54. Concrete patios, driveways and sidewalks, on grade.

2013 17-04. Table 1705.3 of the 2013 Edition of the California Building Code is amended to
read as follows:

TABLE 1705.3
REQUIRED VERIFICATION AND INSPECTION OF CONCRETE CONSTRUCTION

VERIFICATION AND CONTINUOUS | PERIODIC | REFERENCE IBC
INSPECTION STANDARD? | REFERENCE
3. Inspection of anchors
cast in concrete where
ACl| 318: D.9.2 1908.5,
allowable loads have been _ X 813 2148 118 1900.1

increased or where
strength design is used.

4. Inspection of anchors _ ACH318: 48094
post-installed in hardened * 3-8-6-8-13;
concrete members® 24148
a. Adhesive anchors
installed in
horizontally or X ACI _
upwardly inclined 318:D.9.2.4

orientations to

resist sustained

tension loads.

b. Mechanical ACI 318: D.9.2

anchors and

adhesive anchors

not defined in 4.a.
b. Specific requirements for special inspection shall be included in the research report for the
anchor issued by an approved source in accordance with ACI 355.2, D.9.2 in ACI 318, or other
qualification procedures. Where specific requirements are not provided, special inspection
requirements shall be specified by the registered design professional and shall be approved by
the building official prior to the commencement of the work.

I><

(Portions of table not shown remain unchanged.)

2013 17-05. Exception 3 of Section 1705.11 of the 2013 Edition of the California Building Code
is amended to read as follows:

1705.11 Special inspections for seismic resistance. Special inspections itemized in Sections
1705.11.1 through 1705.11.8, unless exempted by the exceptions of Section 1704.2, are
required for the following:



1. The seismic force-resisting systems in structures assigned to Seismic Design Category
C, D, E or F in accordance with Sections 1705.11.1 through 1705.11.3, as applicable.

2. Designated seismic systems in structures assigned to Seismic Design Category C, D, E
or F in accordance with Section 1705.11.4.

3. Architectural, mechanical and electrical components in accordance with Sections
1705.11.5 and 1705.11.6.

4. Storage racks in structures assigned to Seismic Design Category D, E or F in
accordance with Section 1705.11.7.

5. Seismic isolation systems in accordance with Section 1705.11.8.

Exception: Special inspections itemized in Sections 1705.11.1 through 1705.11.8 are not
required for structures designed and constructed in accordance with one of the following:

1. The structure consists of light-frame construction; the design spectral response
acceleration at short periods, Sps, as determined in Section 1613.3.4, does not
exceed 0.5; and the building height of the structure does not exceed 35 feet (10 668
mm)

2. The seismic force-resisting system of the structure consists of reinforced masonry or
reinforced concrete; the design spectral response acceleration at short periods, Sps,
as determined in Section 1613.3.4, does not exceed 0.5; and the building height of
the structure does not exceed 25 feet (7620 mm)

3. The structure is a detached one- or two-family dwelling not exceeding two stories
above grade plane, is not assigned to Seismic Design Category D, E or F and does
not have any of the following horizontal or vertical irregularities in accordance with
Section 12.3 of ASCE 7:

3.1 Torsional or extreme torsional irregularity.

3.2 Nonparallel systems irregularity.

3.3 Stiffness-soft story or stiffness-extreme soft story irregularity.
3.4 Discontinuity in lateral strength-weak story irregularity.

2013 17-06. Section 1711.1.1, Section 1711.1.2 and Chapter 35 of the 2013 Edition of the
California Building Code are amended to read as follows:

1711.1.1 General. The vertical load-bearing capacity, torsional moment capacity and deflection
characteristics of joist hangers shall be determined in accordance with ASTM D 1761 and
ASTM D 7147 as specified below using lumber having a specific gravity of 0.49 or greater, but
not greater than 0.55, as determined in accordance with AF&PA NDS for the joist and headers.

Exception: The joist length shall not be required to exceed 24 inches (610 mm).

1711.1.2 Vertical load capacity for joist hangers. The vertical load-bearing capacity for the




joist hanger shall be determined by testing a minimum of three joist hanger assemblies as
specified in ASTM D 1761 or ASTM D 7147. If the ultimate vertical load for any one of the tests
varies more than 20 percent from the average ultimate vertical load, at least three additional
tests shall be conducted. The allowable vertical load-bearing of the joist hanger shall be the
lowest value determined from the following: -

1. The lowest ultimate vertical load for a single hanger from any test divided by three
(where three tests are conducted and each ultimate vertical load does not vary more
than 20 percent from the average ultimate vertical load).

2. The average ultimate vertical load for a single hanger from all tests divided by three
(where six or more tests are conducted).

3. The average from all tests of the vertical loads that produce a vertical movement of the
joist with respect to the header of 1/8 inch (3.2 mm).

4. The sum of the allowable design loads for nails or other fasteners utilized to secure the
joist hanger to the wood members and allowable bearing loads that contribute to the
capacity of the hanger.

5. The allowable design load for the wood members forming the connection.

Amend the Reference Standards in Chapter 35 for ASTM as follows:

p-1761—06 Test Method for Mechanical Fasteners in Wood 1711.11
D 1761-88(2000) 1711.1.2
11 1711.1.3
D 7147-05 Standard Specification for Testing and Establishing 1711.1.1

Allowable Loads of Joist Hangers 1711.1.2

“§ 15.04.290 CHAPTER 18 AMENDED - SOILS AND FOUNDATIONS

2013 18-01. Section 1807.1.4 of the 2013 Edition of the California Building Code is amended to
read as follows:

1807.1.4 Permanent wood foundation systems. Permanent wood foundation systems shall
be designed and installed in accordance with AF&PA PWF. Lumber and plywood shall be
treated in accordance with AWPA U1 (Commodity Specification A, Use Category 4B and
Section 5.2) and shall be identified in accordance with Section 2303.1.8.1. Permanent wood
foundation systems shall not be used for structures assigned to Seismic Design Category D, E
orF.

2013 18-02. Section 1807.1.6 of the 2013 Edition of the California Building Code is amended to
read as follows:

1807.1.6 Prescriptive design of concrete and masonry foundation walls. Concrete and
masonry foundation walls that are laterally supported at the top and bottom shail be permitted to
be designed and constructed in accordance with this section. Prescriptive design of foundation
walls shall not be used for structures assigned to Seismic Design Category D, E or F.

2013 18-03. Section 1809.3 of the 2013 Edition of the California Building Code is amended to




read as follows:

1809.3 Stepped footings. The top surface of footings shall be level. The bottom surface of
footings shall be permitted to have a slope not exceeding one unit vertical in 10 units horizontal
(10-percent slope). Footings shall be stepped where it is necessary to change the elevation of
the top surface of the footing or where the surface of the ground slopes more than one unit
vertical in 10 units horizontal (10-percent slope).

For structures assigned to Seismic Design Category D, E or F, the stepping requirement
shall also apply to the top surface of grade beams supporting walls. Footings shall be reinforced
with four No. 4 rebar. Two bars shall be place at the top and bottom of the footings as shown in

Figure 1809.3.

MIN, 2-#4 REBAR {TOP & BOTTOM)
— = rmomms (TYP)

B AN
..y h

s =ns

STEPPED FOUNDATIONS

FIGURE 1809.3
STEPPED FOOTING

2013 18-04. Section 1809.7 and Table 1809.7 of the 2013 Edition of the California Building
Code are amended to read as follows:

1809.7 Prescriptive footings for light-frame construction. Where a specific design is not
provided, concrete or masonry-unit footings supporting walls of light-frame construction shall be
permitted to be designed in accordance with Table 1809.7. Prescriptive footings in Table 1809.7
shall not exceed one story above grade plane for structures assigned to Seismic Design
Category D, E or F.

TABLE 1809.7
PRESCRIPTIVE FOOTINGS SUPPORTING WALLS OF
LIGHT-FRAME CONSTRUCTION ™ ¢d.¢

NUMBER OF FLOORS WIDTH OF
SUPPORTED BY THE FOOTING THICKNESS OF
FOOTING | (inches) FOOTING (inches)
1 12 6
2 15 6
3 18 8¢

For Sl: 1 inch = 25.4 mm, 1 foot = 304.8 mm




a. Depth of footings shall be in accordance with Section 1809.4.
b. The ground under the floor shall be permitted to be excavated to the elevation of the

top of the footing.

- Not Adopted.

d. See Section 1908 for additional requirements for concrete footings of structures
assigned to Seismic Design Category C, D, E or F.

e. For thickness of foundation walls, see Section 1807.1.6.

f Footings shall be permitted to support a roof addition to the stipulated number of

floors. Footings supporting roof only shall be as required for supporting one floor.

ha N

2013 18-05. Section 1809.12 of the 2013 Edition of the California Building Code is amended to
read as follows:

1809.12 Timber footings. Timber footings shall be permitted for buildings of Type V
construction and as otherwise approved by the building official. Such footings shall be treated in
accordance with AWPA U1 (Commodity Specification A, Use Category 4B). Treated timbers are
not required where placed entirely below permanent water level, or where used as capping for
wood piles that project above the water level over submerged or marsh lands. The compressive
stresses perpendicular to grain in untreated timber footing supported upon treated piles shall not
exceed 70 percent of the allowable stresses for the species and grade of timber as specified in
the AF&PA NDS. Timber footings shall not be used in structures assigned to Seismic Design

Category D, E or F.

2013 18-06. Section 1810.3.2.4 of the 2013 Edition of the California Building Code is amended
to read as follows:

1810.3.2.4 Timber. Timber deep foundation elements shall be designed as piles or poles in
accordance with AF&PA NDS. Round timber elements shall conform to ASTM D 25. Sawn
timber elements shall conform to DOC PS-20. Timber shall not be used in structures assigned
to Seismic Design Category D, E or F.”

“§ Section 15.04.300 CHAPTER 19 AMENDED - CONCRETE

2013 19-01. Section 1905.1.3 of the 2013 Edition of the California Building Code is amended to
read as follows:

1905.1.3 ACI 318, Section 21.4. Modify ACI 318, Section 21.4, by renumbering Section 21.4.3
to become 21.4.4 and adding new Sections 21.4.3, 21.4.5, 21.4.6 and 21.4.7 to read as follows:

21.4.3 — Connections that are designed to yield shall be capable of maintaining 80 percent
of their design strength at the deformation induced by the design displacement or shall use
Type 2 mechanical splices.

21.4.4 — Elements of the connection that are not designed to yield shall develop at least 1.5

21.4.5 — Wall piers-in-Seismic-Dosi D.—E or-F-shall-comply-with on-1805-1-4
of-the-International-Building-Cede—In structures assigned to Seismic Design Category D, E




or F. intermediate precast wall panels and wall piers shall _be designed in accordance with
Section 21.9 or 21.13.

21.4.6 — Wall piers not designed as part of a moment frame in buildings assigned to Seismic
Design Category C shall have transverse reinforcement designed to resist the shear forces
determined from 21.3.3. Spacing of transverse reinforcement shall not exceed 8 inches (203
mm). Transverse reinforcement shall be extended beyond the pier clear height for at least
12 inches (305 mm).

Exceptions:
1. Wall piers that satisfy 21.13.

2. Wall piers along a wall line within a story where other shear wall segments
provide lateral support to the wall piers and such segments have a total stiffness
of at least six times the sum of the stiffnesses of all the wall piers.

21.4.7 — Wall segments with a horizontal length-to-thickness ratio less than 2.5 shall be
designed as columns.

2013 19-02. Section 1905.1.8 of the 2013 Edition of the California Building Code is amended
to read as follows:

1905.1.8 ACI 318, Section 22.10. Delete ACI 318, Section 22.10, and replace with the
following:

22.10 - Plain concrete in structures assigned to Seismic Design Category C, D, E or F.

22.10.1 — Structures assigned to Seismic Design Category C, D, E or F shall not have
elements of structural plain concrete, except as follows:

aeeerdanee—w;th—&%é—é—&Concrete used for fI/I w:th a minimum cement content of
two (2) sacks of Portland cement or cementious material per cubic yard.

(b) Isolated footings of plain concrete supporting pedestals or columns are permitted,
provided the projection of the footing beyond the face of the supported member does
not exceed the footing thickness.

(c) Plain concrete footings supporting walls are permitted provided the footings have at
least two continuous longitudinal reinforcing bars. Bars shall not be smaller than No.
4 and shall have a total area of not Iess than 0 002 times the gross cross—sectlonal




minimum of one bar shall be provided at the top and bottom of the footing. Continuity
of reinforcement shall be provided at corners and intersections.

4—In Swsnwe—D&ygn—Categeﬁas—A—B—and—G——detached one- and two-family

dwellings three stories or less in height and constructed with stud-bearing walls,

are permitted to have plain concrete footings witheut-longitudinal-reinforcement

with at least two continuous longitudinal reinforcing bars not smaller than No. 4
are permitted to have a total area of less than 0.002 times the gross cross-
sectional area of the footing.

2013 19-03. Section 1905.1 is amended and Sections 1905.1.10 thru 1905.1.12 are added to
Chapter 19 of the 2013 Edition of the California Building Code to read as follows:

1905.1 General. The text of AClI 318 shall be modified as indicated in Sections 1905.1.1
through 4808-4-401905.1.12.

1905.1.10 ACI 318, Section 21.6.4. Modify AC| 318, Section 21.6.4, by adding Section 21.6.4.8
and 12.6.4.9 as follows:

21.6.4.8 Where the calculated point of contraflexure is not within the middle half of the
member clear height, provide transverse reinforcement as specified in ACl 318 Sections
21.6.4.1, Items (a) through (c), over the full height of the member.

21.6.4.9 — At any section where the design strength, oP,, of the column is less than the sum
of the shears V. computed in accordance with ACI 318 Sections 21.5.4.1 and 21.6.5.1 for all
the beams framing into the column above the level under consideration, transverse
reinforcement as specified in ACl 318 Sections 21.6.4.1 through 21.6.4.3 shall be provided.
For beams framing into opposite sides of the column, the moment components are
permitted to be assumed to be of opposite sign. For the determination of the design
strength, ¢P,, of the column, these moments are permitted to be assumed to result from the
deformation of the frame in any one principal axis.

1905.1.11 ACI 318, Section 21.9.4. Modify ACI 318, Section 21.9.4, by adding Section 21.9.4.6
as follows:

21.9.4.6 — Walls and portions of walls with P, > 0.35P, shall not be considered to contribute
to the calculated shear strength of the structure for resisting earthquake-induced forces.
Such walls shall conform to the requirements of ACl 318 Section 21.13.

1905.1.12 ACI 318, Section 21.11.6. Modify ACI 318, by adding Section 21.11.6.1as follows:

21.11.6.1 Collector and boundary elements in topping slabs placed over precast floor and
roof elements shall not be less than 3 inches (76 mm) or 6 d, in thickness, where d, is the




diameter of the largest reinforcement in the topping slab. “

“§ 15.04.320 CHAPTER 23 AMENDED - WOOD

2013 23-01. Section 2304.9.1 of the 2013 Edition of the California Building Code is amended to
read as follows:

2304.9.1 Fastener requirements. Connections for wood members shall be designed in
accordance with the appropriate methodology in Section 2301.2. The number and size of
fasteners connecting wood members shall not be less than that set forth in Table 2304.9.1.
Staple fasteners in Table 2304.9.1 shall not be used to resist or transfer seismic forces in

structures assigned to Seismic Design Category D, E or F.

Exception: Staples may be used to resist or transfer seismic forces when the allowable
shear values are substantiated by cyclic testing and approved by the building official.

2013 23-02. Section 2304.11.7 of the 2013 Edition of the California Building Code is amended
to read as follows:

2304.11.7 Wood used in retaining walls and cribs. Wood installed in retaining or crib walls
shall be preservative treated in accordance with AWPA U1 (Commodity Specifications A or F)
for soil and fresh water use. Wood shall not be used in retaining or crib walls for structures
assigned to Seismic Design Category D, E or F.

2013 23-03. Section 2305.4 is added to Chapter 23 of the 2013 Edition of the California Building
Code to read as follows:

2305.4 Quality of Nails. In Seismic Design Category D, E or F, mechanically driven nails used
in wood structural panel shear walls shall meet the same dimensions as that required for hand-
driven nails, including diameter, minimum length and minimum head diameter. Clipped head or
box nails are not permitted in new construction. The allowable design value for clipped head
nails in existing construction may be taken at no more than the nail-head-area ratio of that of the
same size hand-driven nails.

2013 23-04. Section 2305.5 is added to Chapter 23 of the 2013 Edition of the California Building
Code to read as follows:

2305.5 Hold-down connectors. In Seismic Design Category D, E or F, hold-down connectors
shall be designed to resist shear wall overturning moments using approved cyclic load values or
75 percent of the allowable seismic load values that do not consider cyclic loading of the
product. Connector bolts into wood framing shall require steel plate washers on the post on the

opposite side of the anchorage device. Plate size shall be a minimum of 0.229 inch by 3 inches
by 3 inches (5.82 mm by 76 mm by 76 mm) in size. Hold-down connectors shall be tightened to
finger tight plus one half (1/2) wrench turn just prior to covering the wall framing.

2013 23-05. Section 2306.2 of the 2013 Edition of the California Building Code is amended to
read as follows:

2306.2 Wood-frame diaphragms. Wood-frame diaphragms shall be designed and constructed
in accordance with AF&PA SDPWS. Where panels are fastened to framing members with
staples, requirements and limitations of AF&PA SDPWS shall be met and the allowable shear
values set forth in Table 2306.2(1) or 2306.2(2) shall only be permitted for structures assigned




to Seismic Design Category A, B, or C.

Exception: Allowable shear values where panels are fastened to framing members with
staples may be used if such values are substantiated by cyclic testing and approved by the
building official.

The allowable shear values in Tables 2306.2(1) and 2306.2(2) are permitted to be increased 40
percent for wind design.

Exception: [DSA-SS, DSA-SS/CC and OSHPD 1, 2 &4] Wood structural panel diaphragms
using staples as fasteners are not permitted by DSA and OSHPD.

Wood structural panel diaphragms used to resist seismic forces in structures assigned to
Seismic Design Cateqory D, E or F shall be applied directly to the framing members.

Exception: Wood structural panel diaphragms are permitted to be fastened over solid
lumber planking or laminated decking, provided the panel joints and lumber planking or

laminated decking joints do not coincide.

2013 23-06. Section 2306.3 is amended and Section 2307.2 is added to the 2013 Edition of the
California Building Code to read as follows:

2306.3 Wood-frame shear walls. Wood-frame shear walls shall be designed and constructed
in accordance with AF&PA SDPWS. For structures assigned to Seismic Design Category D, E,
or F. application of Tables 4.3A and 4.3B of AF&PA SDPWS shall include the following:

1. Wood structural panel thickness for shear walls shall not be less than 3/8 inch thick and
studs shall not be spaced at more than 16 inches on center.

2. The maximum nominal unit shear capacities for 3/8 inch wood structural panels resisting

seismic forces in structures assigned to Seismic Design Category D, E or F is 400
pounds per linear foot (plf).

Exception: Other nominal unit shear _capacities may be permitted if such values are
substantiated by cyclic testing and approved by the building official.

3. Where shear design values using allow stress design (ASD) exceed 350 plif or load and
resistance factor design (LRFD) exceed 500 plf all framing members receiving edge
nailing from abutting panels shall not be less than a single 3-inch nominal member, or
two 2-inch nominal members fastened together in_accordance with Section 2306.1 to
transfer the design shear value between framing members. Wood structural panel joint
and sill plate nailing shall be staggered at all panel edges. See Section 4.3.6.1 and
4.3.6.4.3 of AF&PA SDPWS for sill plate size and anchorage requirements.

4. Nails shall be placed not less than 1/2 inch in from the panel edges and not less than 3/8
inch from the edge of the connecting members for shear greater than 350 plf using ASD
or 500 pif using LRFD. Nails shall be placed not less than 3/8 inch from panel edges and
not less than 1/4 inch from the edge of the connecting members for shears of 350 plif or
less using ASD or 500 plf or less using LRFD.

5. Table 4.3B application is not allowed for structures assigned to Seismic Design Category
D, E, orF.




For structures assigned to Seismic Design Category D, application of Table 4.3C of AF&PA
SDPWS shall not be used below the top level in a multi-level building for structures.

Where panels are fastened to framing members with staples, requirements and limitations of
AF&PA SDPWS shall be met and the allowable shear values set forth in Table 2306.3(1),
2306.3(2) or 2306.3(3) shall only be permitted for structures assigned to Seismic Design
Category A, B, or C.

Exception: Allowable shear values where panels are fastened to framing members with

staples may be used if such values are substantiated by cyclic testing and approved by the
building official.

The allowable shear values in Tables 2306.3(1) and 2306.3(2) are permitted to be increased 40
percent for wind design. Panels complying with ANSI/APA PRP-210 shall be permitted to use
design values for Plywood Siding in the AF&PA SDPWS.

Exception: [DSA-SS 7DSA-SS/CC and OSHPD 1, 2 &4] Wood structural panel shear walls
using staples as fasteners are not permitted by DSA and OSHPD.

2307.2 Wood-frame shear walls. Wood-frame shear walls shall be designed and constructed
in accordance with Section 2306.3 as applicable.

2013 23-07. Section 2308.3.4 of Chapter 23 of the 2013 Edition of the California Building
Code is amended to read as follows:

2308.3.4 Braced wall line support. Braced wall lines shall be supported by continuous
foundations.

Exception: For structures with a maximum plan dimension not over 50 feet (15240 mm),
continuous foundations are required at exterior walls only for structures assigned to Seismic
Desigh Category A, B, or C.

2013 23-08. Section 2308.9.3.1, Section 2308.9.3.2 and Figure 2308.9.3.2 of the 2013 Edition
of the California Building Code are amended to read as foliow:

2308.9.3.1 Alternative bracing. Any bracing required by Section 2308.9.3 is permitted to be
replaced by the following:

1. In one-story buildings, each panel shall have a length of not less than 2 feet 8 inches
(813 mm) and a height of not more than 10 feet (3048 mm). Each panel shall be
sheathed on one face with 3/8-inch-minimum-thickness (9.5 mm) wood structural panel
sheathing nailed with 8d common or galvanized box nails in accordance with Table
2304.9.1 and blocked at wood structural panel edges. For_ structures assigned to
Seismic Design Category D or E, each panel shall be sheathed on one face with 15/32-
inch-minimum-thickness (11.9 mm) wood structural panel sheathing nailed with 8d
common nails spaced 3 inches on panel edges, 3 inches at intermediate supports. Two
anchor bolts installed in accordance with Section 2308.6 shall be provided in each panel.
Anchor bolts shall be placed at each panel outside quarter points. Each panel end stud
shall have a tie-down device fastened to the foundation, capable of providing an
approved uplift capacity of not less than 1,800 pounds (8006 N). The tie-down device
shall be installed in accordance with the manufacturer's recommendations. The panels




shall be supported directly on a foundation or on floor framing supported directly on a
foundation that is continuous across the entire length of the braced wall line. This
foundation shall be reinforced with not less than one No. 4 bar top and bottom.

Where the continuous foundation is required to have a depth greater than 12 inches
(305 mm), a minimum 12-inch by 12-inch (305 mm by 305 mm) continuous footing or
turned down slab edge is permitted at door openings in the braced wall line. This
continuous footing or turned down slab edge shall be reinforced with not less than one
No. 4 bar top and bottom. This reinforcement shall be lapped 15 inches (381 mm) with
the reinforcement required in the continuous foundation located directly under the
braced wall line.

In the first story of two-story buildings, each wall panel shall be braced in accordance
with Section 2308.9.3.1, ltem 1, except that the wood structural panel sheathing shall be
provided on both faces, three anchor bolts shall be placed at one-quarter points, and tie-
down device uplift capacity shall not be less than 3,000 pounds (13 344 N).

2308.9.3.2 Alternate bracing wall panel adjacent to a door or window opening. Any bracing
required by Section 2308.9.3 is permitted to be replaced by the following when used adjacent to
a door or window opening with a full-length header:

1.

In one-story buildings, each panel shall have a length of not less than 16 inches (406
mm) and a height of not more than 10 feet (3048 mm). Each panel shall be sheathed on
one face with a single layer of 3/8 inch (9.5 mm) minimum thickness wood structural
pane! sheathing nailed with 8d common or galvanized box nails in accordance with
Figure 2308.9.3.2. For structures assigned to Seismic Design Category D or E, each
panel shall be sheathed on one face with 15/32-inch-minimum-thickness (11.9 mm)
wood structural panel sheathing nailed with 8d common nails spaced 3 inches on panel
edges. 3 inches at intermediate supports and in accordance with Figure 2308.9.3.2. The
wood structural panel sheathing shall extend up over the solid sawn or glued-laminated
header and shall be nailed in accordance with Figure 2308.9.3.2. A built-up header
consisting of at least two 2 x 12s and fastened in accordance with Item 24 of Table
2304.9.1 shall be permitted to be used. A spacer, if used, shall be placed on the side of
the built-up beam opposite the wood structural panel sheathing. The header shall extend
between the inside faces of the first full-length outer studs of each panel. The clear span
of the header between the inner studs of each panel shall be not less than 6 feet (1829
mm) and not more than 18 feet (5486 mm) in length. A strap with an uplift capacity of not
less than 1,000 pounds (4,400 N) shall fasten the header to the inner studs opposite the
sheathing. One anchor bolt not less than 5/8 inch (15.9 mm) diameter and installed in
accordance with Section 2308.6 shall be provided in the center of each sill plate. The
studs at each end of the panel shall have a tie-down device fastened to the foundation
with an uplift capacity of not less than 4,200 pounds (18 480 N).

Where a panel is located on one side of the opening, the header shall extend between
the inside face of the first full-length stud of the panel and the bearing studs at the other
end of the opening. A strap with an uplift capacity of not less than 1,000 pounds (4400
N) shall fasten the header to the bearing studs. The bearing studs shall also have a tie-
down device fastened to the foundation with an uplift capacity of not less than 1,000
pounds (4400 N).

The tie-down devices shall be an embedded strap type, installed in accordance with the
manufacturer's recommendations. The panels shall be supported directly on a




foundation that is continuous across the entire length of the braced wall line. This
foundation shall be reinforced with not less than one No. 4 bar top and bottom.

Where the continuous foundation is required to have a depth greater than 12 inches
(305 mm), a minimum 12-inch by 12-inch (305 mm by 305 mm) continuous footing or
turned down slab edge is permitted at door openings in the braced wall line. This
continuous footing or turned down slab edge shall be reinforced with not less than one
No. 4 bar top and bottom. This reinforcement shall be lapped not less than 15 inches
(381 mm) with the reinforcement required in the continuous foundation located directly
under the braced wall line.

2. In the first story of two-story buildings, each wall panel shall be braced in accordance

" EXTENT OF HEADER R
DOUBLE POATAL FRAME (TWO BRACED WALL PANELS)
EXTENT OF HEADER
4" SINGLE PORTAL FRAME (ONE BRACED WALL PANEL) — "]
A N
X @ ¥
671018 e 1 kK
ng. L o o
n i FASTEN TOP PLATE TO HEADER WITH TWO A TYPICAL PORTAL ; S
RS Re ROWS OF 160 SINKER NAILS AT 3" 0.C. TVR. 100018 ~ | FRAME  kl 4
K a \ STRAP CONSTRUCTION |4 A
ol by 1000 LB STRAP OPPOSITE SHEATHING ik ]
oo . \ FOR APANEL SPLICE \}4* 4
e e FASTEN SHEATHING TO HEADER WITH 80 COMMON OR (IF NEEDED), PANEL Al 4
e o GALVANIZED BOX NAILS IN 3* GRID PATTERN AS SHOWN AND EDGES SHALLBE |\ 4
MAX. L. o 3" O.C. INALL FRAMING (STUDS, BLOCKING, AND SILLS) TYP. BLOCKED, AND OCCUR | 4
HEIGHT |, e WITHIN 24" OF MID- {4 4
10 o o HEIGHT, ONE ROWOF PPt
oo “f .~ MIN. WIDTH = 16" FOR ONE STORY STRUCTURES TP SHEATHING.TO- |1 44
o R | MIN. WIDTH = 24* FOR USE iN THE FIRST OF TWO FRAMING NAILING IS |1 b
N o STORY STRUCTURES AEQUIRED. 111 1
X 7T MIN. 2¢4 FRAMING an IF 2X4 BLOCKING IS 117 3
L L - USED, THE 2X4'S MUST |1 i
A ] 3/8" MIN. THICKNESS WOOD DOUBLE BE NAILED TOGETHER [J[J B
—] a 2x4 POST
B8 RE STRUCTURAL PANEL SHEATHING = 11l WITH 3 18D SINKERS  [4¥ "
ool TR MIN, 4200 LB TIE-DOWN DEVICE (EMBEDDED INTO o i
" i CONCRETE AND NAILED INTO FRAMING) | MIN, 1000 LB T o
on. 'Jat"“'.: AT nEwwN ‘0. -_A_. ‘n.
ofofe a e _sltie S N B e
i =S | e secTioN 2308932 DEVICE Sasss

For SI: 1 foot = 304.8 mm: | inch = 25.4 mm: 1 pound = 4.448 N.
a. For structures i d to ic Design Cat 'y D or E, sheathed on one face with 15:32-inch-mini ick {11.% mum) wood structur al paned sheathing

FIGURE 2308.9.3.2
ALTERNATE BRACED WALL PANEL ADJACENT TO A DOOR OR WINDOW OPENING

with Item 1 above, except that each panel shall have a length of not less than 24 inches
(610 mm).

2013 23-09. Table 2308.12.4 of the 2013 Edition of the California Building Code is amended




to read as follows:

TABLE 2308.12.4
WALL BRACING IN SEISMIC DESIGN CATEGORIES D AND E

(Minimum Percentage of Wall Bracing per each Braced Wall Line*
CONDITI SHEATHING 0.50 <Sps < 0.76 < Sps< S ps >
ON TYPE" Sps < 0.50 0.75 1.00 1.00
Cc
One Story G-P 43 59 75 100
S-w¢ 21 32 37 48

For SI: 1inch =25.4 mm, 1 foot = 304.8 mm.

a. Minimum length of panel bracing of one face of the wall for S-W sheathing shall be at least
4-0” long or both faces of the wall for G-P sheathing shall be at least 8-0" long; h/w ratio
shall not exceed 2:1. For S-W panel bracing of the same material on two faces of the wall,
the minimum length is permitted to be one-half the tabulated value but the h/w ratio shall not
exceed 2:1 and design for uplift is required. The 2:1 h/w ratio limitation does not apply to
alternate braced wall panels constructed in accordance with Section 2308.9.3.1 or
2308.9.3.2. Wall framing to which sheathing used for bracing is applied shall be nominal 2
inch wide [actual 11/2 inch (38 mm)] or larger members and spaced a maximum of 16
inches on center. Braced wall panel construction types shall not be mixed within a braced
wall line.

b. G-P = gypsum board, fiberboard—particlebeardlath-andportland cement plaster or gypsum
sheathing boards; S-W = wood structural panels and-diagonal-wood-sheathing.

c. Nailing as specified below shall occur at all panel edges at studs, at top and bottom plates
and, where occurring, at blocking:
For 1/2-inch gypsum board, 5d (0.113 inch diameter) cooler nails at 7 inches on center;
For 5/8-inch gypsum board, No 11 gage (0.120 inch diameter) cooler nails at 7 inches on
center;
For gypsum sheathing board, 1-3/4 inches long by 7/16-inch head, diamond point
galvanized nails at 4 inches on center,
For gypsum lath, No. 13 gage (0.092 inch) by 1-1/8 inches long, 19/64-inch head,
plasterboard at 5 inches on center;
For Portland cement plaster, No. 11 gage (0.120 inch) by 1"/, inches long, “/16- inch head at

6 inches on center;
' ard-—a Y inchestong— fs—inch

d. S-W ’sheathinq shall be a minimum of 15/32;’ thick nailed with 8d common placed 3/8 inches
from panel edges and spaced not more than 6 inches on center and 12 inches on center
along intermediate framing members.

2013 23-10. Section 2308.12.5 of the 2013 Edition of the California Building Code is amended
to read as follows:

2308.12.5 Attachment of sheathing. Fastening of braced wall panel sheathing shall not be
less than that prescribed in Table 2308.12.4 or 2304.9.1. Wall sheathing shall not be attached to
framing members by adhesives. Staple fasteners in Table 2304.9.1 shall not be used to resist or
transfer seismic forces in structures assigned to Seismic Design Category D, E or F.

Exception: Staples may be used to resist or transfer seismic forces when the allowable
shear values are substantiated by cyclic testing and approved by the building official.




All braced wall panels shall extend to the roof sheathing and shall be attached to parallel
roof rafters or blocking above with framing clips (18 gauge minimum) spaced at maximum 24
inches (6096 mm) on center with four 8d nails per leg (total eight 8d nails per clip). Braced wall
panels shall be laterally braced at each top corner and at maximum 24 inches (6096 mm)
intervals along the top plate of discontinuous vertical framing.

RESIDENTIAL CODE AMENDMENTS
“§ 15.04.440 CHAPTER 3 AMENDED — BUILDING PLANNING

2013 R3-01. Section R301.1.3.2 of the 2013 Edition of the California Residential Code is
amended to read as follows:

R301.1.3.2 Woodframe structures-greater-than-two-stories. The building official shall require
construction documents to be approved and stamped by a California licensed architect or
engineer for all dwellings of wood frame construction more than two stories and basement in
height_located in Seismic Design Category A, B or C. Notwithstanding other sections of law; the
law establishing these provisions is found in Business and Professions Code Section 5537 and
6737.1.

The building official shall require construction documents to be approved and stamped by a
California licensed architect or engineer for all dwellings of wood frame construction more than
one story in height or with a basement located in Seismic Design Category Do, D4, D, or E.

2013 R3-02. Section R301.1.4 is added to Chapter 3 of the 2013 Edition of the California
Residential Code to read as follows:

R301.1.4 Seismic design provisions for buildings constructed on or into slopes steeper
than_one unit vertical in three units horizontal (33.3 percent slope). The design and
construction of new buildings and additions to existing buildings when constructed on or into
slopes steeper than one unit vertical in three units horizontal (33.3 percent slope) shall comply
with Section 1613.9 of the Building Code.

2013 R03-03. Table R301.2.2.1.1 and Section R301.2.2.1.2 of the 2013 Edition of the California
Residential Code are amended to read as follows:

TABLE R301.2.2.1.1
SEISMIC DESIGN CATEGORY DETERMINATION

CALCULATED Sps SEISMIC DESIGN CATEGORY
Sps £ 0.17g A
0.17g < Sps = 0.33g B
0.33g < Sps = 0.50g Cc
0.50g < Sps £0.67g Do
0.67g < Sps =0.83g D,
0.83g < Sps < +25¢-1.00g D,
—-28¢-1.00g < Sps E

R301.2.2.1.2 Alternative determination of Seismic Design Category E. Buildings located in
Seismic Design Category E in accordance with Figure R301.2(2) are permitted to be reclassified




as being in Seismic Design Category D, provided one of the following is done:

1.

A more detailed evaluation of the seismic design category is made in accordance with
the provisions and maps of the California Building Code. Buildings located in Seismic
Design Category E per Table R301.2.2.1.1, but located in Seismic Design Category D
per the California Building Code, may be designed using the Seismic Design Category
D, requirements of this code.

Buildings located in Seismic Design Category E that conform to the following additional
restrictions are permitted to be constructed in accordance with the provisions for Seismic
Design Category D, of this code:

2.1.  All exterior shear wall lines or braced wall panels are in one plane vertically from
the foundation to the uppermost story.

2.2.  Floors shall not cantilever past the exterior walls.

2.3.  The building is within all of the requirements of Section R301.2.2.2.5 for being
considered as regular.

2.4. For buildings over one story in height, the calculated Sps shall not exceed 1.259.

2013 R3-04. ltems 1, 3 and 5 of Section R301.2.2.2.5 of the 2013 Edition of the California
Residential Code are amended to read as follows:

1. When exterior shear wall lines or braced wall panels are not in one plane vertically from the
foundation to the uppermost story in which they are required.

3. When the end of a braced wall panel occurs over an opening in the wall below-and-ends-at-a



2013 R3-05. Section R301.2.2.3.8 is added to Chapter 3 of the 2013 Edition of the California
Residential Code to read as follows:

R301.2.2.3.8 Anchorage of Mechanical, Electrical, or Plumbing Components and
Equipment. Mechanical, electrical, or plumbing components and equipment shall be anchored
to the structure. Anchorage of the components and equipment shall be designed to resist loads
in accordance with the International Building Code and ASCE 7, except where the component is
positively attached to the structure and flexible connections are provided between the
component and associated ductwork, piping, and conduit; and either

1. The component weighs 400 Ib (1,780 N) or less and has a center of mass located 4 ft
(1.22 m) or less above the supporting structure; or

2. The component weighs 20 |b (89N) or less or, in the case of a distributed system, 5 lb/ft
(73 N/m) or less.

2013 R4-01. Section R401.1 of the 2013 Edition of the California Residential Code is amended
to read as follows:




R401.1 Application. The provisions of this chapter shall control the design and construction of
the foundation and foundation spaces for all buildings. In addition to the provisions of this
chapter, the design and construction of foundations in areas prone to flooding as established by
Table R301.2(1) shall meet the provisions of Section R322. Wood foundations shall be
designed and installed in accordance with AF&PA PWF.

Exception: The provisions of this chapter shall be permitted to be used for wood
foundations only in the following situations:

1. In buildings that have no more than two floors and a roof.

2. When interior basement and foundation walls are constructed at intervals not
exceeding 50 feet (15 240 mm).

Wood foundations in Seismic Design Category Dy, Dy or D, shall be-designed-in-accordance
with-accepted-engineering-prastice-not be permitted.

Exception: In non-occupied, single-story, detached storage sheds and similar uses other
than carport or garage, provided the gross floor area does not exceed 200 square feet, the
plate height does not exceed 12 feet in height above the grade plane at any point, and the
maximum roof projection does not exceed 24 inches.

2013 R4-02. Sections R403.1.2, R403.1.3 and R403.1.5 of the 2013 Edition of the California
Residential Code are amended to read as follows:

R403.1.2 Continuous footing in Seismic Design Categories Dy, Dy and D,. The braced wall
panels at exterior walls of buildings located in Seismic Design Categories Do, D4 and D, shall be

supported by continuous footings. All required interior braced wall panels in buildings with-plan
shall alse-be supported by continuous footings.

R403.1.3 Seismic reinforcing. Concrete footings located in Seismic Design Categories Do, D,
and D, as established in Table R301.2(1), shall have minimum reinforcement. Bottom
reinforcement shall be located a minimum of 3 inches (76 mm) clear from the bottom of the

footing.

In Seismic Design Categories D,, Dy and D, where construction joint is created between a
concrete footing and a stem wall, a minimum of one No. 4 bar shall be installed at not more than
4 feet (1219 mm) on center. The vertical bar shall extend to 3 inches (76 mm) clear of the
bottom of the footing, have a standard hook and extend a minimum of 14 inches (357 mm) into
the stem wall.

In Seismic Design Categories Do, Dy and D, where a grouted masonry stem wall is
supported on a concrete footing and stem wall, a minimum of one No. 4 bar shall be installed at
not more than 4 feet (1219 mm) on center. The vertical bar shall extend to 3 inches (76 mm)
clear of the bottom of the footing and have a standard hook.

In Seismic Design Categories Dy, D; and D, masonry stem walls without solid grout and
vertical reinforcing are not permitted.

Exception: In detached one- and two-family dwellings located in Seismic Design Category
A, B or C which are three stories or less in height and constructed with stud bearing walls,




isolated plain concrete footings, supporting columns or pedestals are permitted.

R403.1.5 Slope. The top surface of footings shall be level. The bottom surface of footings shall
be permitted to have a slope not exceeding one unit vertical in 10 units horizontal (10-percent
slope). Footings shall be stepped where it is necessary to change the elevation.of the top
surface of the footing or where the surface of the ground slopes more than one unit vertical in
10 units horizontal (10-percent slope).

For structures located in Seismic Design Categories Dy, D, or D,, stepped footings shall be
reinforced with four No. 4 rebar. Two bars shall be place at the top and bottom of the footings as
shown in Fiqure R403.1.5.

BECOMMEND: 2> b
b 20"

STEPPED FOUNDATIONS

FIGURE R403.1.5
STEPPED FOOTING

2013 R313.1. Section R313.1 of the Residential Code is amended to read as follows:

R313.1 Where required. Approved automatic extinguishing systems shall be installed:
1. In all new R-2 occupancies.

EXCEPTIONS:
A) Detached Group U occupancies, providing the floor area does not exceed 1000

square feet.

B) Other minor buildings and/or occupancies as approved by the Fire Chief.

2. In existing Group R-2 Occupancies in which an addition of at least 50 percent of the existing
square footage takes place.

R313.1.1 Design and installation. Automatic residential sprinkler systems for R-2
occupancies shall be designed and installed in accordance with NFPA 13D or NFPA 13R as
amended by the Monrovia Municipal Code.

2013 R313.2. Section 313.2 of the Residential Code is amended to read as follows:

R313.2 One- and two-family dwelling automatic fire systems. Approved automatic
extinguishing systems shall be installed in all new R-3 occupancies.




EXCEPTIONS:

A) Detached Group U occupancies, providing the floor area does not exceed 1000 square feet.

B) Other minor buildings and/or occupancies as approved by the Fire Chief-
2. Existing Group R-3 Occupancies in which an addition of at least 50 percent of the existing
square footage takes place.

R313.2.1 Design and installation. Automatic residential sprinkler systems for R-3 occupancies
shall be designed and installed in accordance with NFPA 13D as amended by the Monrovia
Municipal Code.

2013 R313.3. Section 313.1 of the Residential Code is deleted in its entirety and amended to
read as follows:

R313.3 Dwelling unit fire sprinkler systems. Dwelling unit fire sprinkler systems shall be
designed and installed in accordance with NFPA 13D or NFPA 13R as amended by this section.

R313.3.1 NFPA 13R Sprinkler systems. Where allowed in buildings of Group R, up to and
including buildings four stories in height, automatic sprinkler systems shall be installed
throughout in accordance with NFPA 13R with the following additions:

A) Attics shall be fully sprinklered with quick-response intermediate temperature heads.

B) Private garages shall be sprinklered and shall have a design density of an Ordinary Hazard
Group 1 occupancy with a design area of two (2) heads. Quick-response intermediate
temperature commercial type heads shall be used for the garage area.

C) A single exterior bell activated by the waterflow switch shall be provided at an approved
location.

R313.3.2 NFPA 13D Sprinkler systems. Where allowed, automatic sprinkler systems installed
in one-and two-family dwellings shall be installed throughout in accordance with NFPA 13D with
the following additions:

A) Attics containing forced air units shall have one or more quick-response intermediate
temperature sprinkler heads adjacent to each unit.

B) Attached private garages shall be sprinklered and shall have a design density of an Ordinary
Hazard Group 1 occupancy with a design area of two (2) heads. Quick-response intermediate
temperature commercial type heads shall be used for the garage area.

C) Attics and basements used for storage purposes shall be fully sprinklered with residential
type heads.

D) A single exterior bell activated by the waterflow switch shall be provided at an approved
location.

2013 R4-03. Section R404.2 of the 2013 Edition of the California Residential Code is amended
to read as follows:

R404.2 Wood foundation walls. Wood foundation walls shall be constructed in accordance




with the provisions of Sections R404.2.1 through R404.2.6 and with the details shown in Figures
R403.1(2) and R403.1(3)._Wood foundation walls shall not be used for structures located in

Seismic Design Category Dy, Dy or D,.

2013 R5-01. Section R501.1 of the 2013 Edition of the California Residential Code is amended
to read as follows:

R501.1 Application. The provisions of this chapter shall control the design and construction of
the floors for all buildings including the floors of attic spaces used to house mechanical or
plumbing fixtures and equipment. Mechanical or plumbing fixtures and equipment shall be
attached (or anchored) to the structure in accordance with Section R301.2.2.3.8

2013 R5-02. Section R503.2.4 is added to Chapter 5 of the 2013 Edition of the California
Residential Code to read as follows:

R503.2.4 Openings in_horizontal diaphragms. Openings in horizontal diaphragms with a
dimension perpendicular to the joist that is greater than 4 feet (1.2 m) shall be constructed in
accordance with Figure R503.2.4.

PLYWQOD SHEATHING
DIAPHRAGM OPENING

METAL TIE t6GA. x 1 1/2° x 40" MIN., {4 TOTAL)
W/ 18-18d COMMON NAILE AS SHOWN

“OR-

METAL TIE 18GA. x 1 1/2" x (OPENING WIDTH + 407} MIN.,
(2 TOTAL) W/24-16d COMMON NAILS

For Sk 1 inch =254 mm, | foot=304.8 mm.

a. Blockings shall be provided beyond headers.

b. Metal ties not less than 0.058 inch [1.47 mm (16 galvanized gage)] by 1.5 inches (38 mm)
wide with eight 16d common nails on each side of the header-joist intersection. The metal
ties shall have a minimum yield of 33,000 psi (227 MPa).

c. _Openings in diaphragms shall be further limited in accordance with Section R301.2.2.2.5.

FIGURE R503.2.4
OPENINGS IN HORIZONTAL DIAPHRAGMS

2013 R6-01. Lines 37 and 38 of Table R602.3(1) of the 2013 Edition of the California




Residential Code are amended to read as follows:

TABLE R602.3(1)—continued
FASTENER SCHEDULE FOR STRUCTURAL MEMBERS
SPACING OF FASTENERS
ITEM |DESCRIPTION OF BUILDING MATERIALS DESCRIPTION OF FASTENERP & Edges | Intormediate supporta®®
(inches)' {inches)
Wood ctural panel bl roof and interior wall sheathing to framing and particleboard wall sheathing to framing
32 oA 6d common (2" x 0.113") nail (subfloor wall) P 12
§ 30 8d common {2Y," x €.131%) nail (roof)’
3 RN T 8d common nail (27," x 0.1317) 6 12
Tr e iy 10d common (3" x (1.148") nail or
4 V-1, 84 (21, x 0.131") deformed nail 6 12
Other wall sheathing®
35 i, structural cellulosic 1%, galvanized roofing nail, 7/,;” crown or 1" crowa 3 6
fiberboard sheathing staple 16 ga., 1'/,” long
3 *,," structural cellulosic 134,” gaivanized roofing nail, /" crown or 1” crown 3 6
- fiberboard sheathing staple 16 ga., 1Y," long
X e ! . 14," galvanized roofing nail; staple galvanized,
37 /:" gypsum sheathing" 1 'i;"’ long; 1/, screws, Type Wor 8 7 7
T 37 < > T
k 5. X - 1°1,” galvanized roofing nail; staple galvanized,
8 /5" gypsum sheathing 151:" tong; 1%, screws, Type W or 8 ! 7
Wood str | panek binati bl derlayment to framing
3 6d deformed (2" x 0.120") naii or

39 /" and less 8d common (27, x 0.1317) nail 6 12
40 Yo g 8d common {2'/," x 0.131") nail or 6 12

& 8d deformed (2'/,” % 0.120) nail -
) Yo fi e 10d conumon (3” x {.148") nail or .
4 - Vg 8d deformed (21, x 0.120”) nail 6 12

For Sk 1 inch = 25.4 mm, 1 foot = 304.8 mm, 1 mile per hour = 0.447 my/s; 1 Kisi = 6.895 MPa,

a. Al nails are smooth-common, box or deformed shanks except where otherwise stated. Nails used for framing and sheathing connections shall have minimum
average bending yield strengths as shown: 80 ksi for shank diameter of 0.192 inch (20d common nail), 90 ksi for shank diameters larger than 0.142 inch but
not Jarger than 0,177 inch, and 100 ksi for shank diametees of 0.142 inch or less.

b. Staples are 16 gage wire and have & minimum 71,-inch on diameter crown width.

¢. Nails shall be spaced af not more than 6 inches on center at all supports where spans are 48 inches or greater.

d. Four-foot by 8-foot or 4-foot by 9-foot panels shall be applied vertically.

¢. Spacing of fast not included in this table shall be based on Tsble R602.3(2)

f. For regions having basic wind speed of 110 mph or greater, 8d deformed (2", x 0.120) nails shall be used for attaching plywood and wood structural panet
roof sheathing to framing within mini 48-inch distance from gable end walls, if mean roof height is more than 25 feet, up to 35 feet maximum.

g. For regions having basic wind speed of 100 mph or kess, nails for attaching wood structural panel roof sheathing to gable end wall framing shall be spaced 6
inches on center. When basic wind speed is greater than 100 mph, nails for sttaching panel roof sheathing to i linte supports shall be spaced 6 inches on
center for minimum 48-inch distance from ridges, caves and gable end walls; and 4 inches on center to gable end wall framing.

h. Gypsum sheathing shall conform to ASTM C 1396 and shall be installed in accordance with GA 253. Fiberboard sheathing shall conform to ASTM C 208.

. Spacing of fasteners on floor sheathing pancl edges applies 1o panel edges supported by framing members and required blocking and at all floor perimeters
only. Spacing of f. on roof sheathing pane} edges applies to panel edges supported by frami bers and required blocking. Blocking of roof or
floor sheathing panel edges perpendicular to the framing members need not be provided except as required by other provisions of this code. Floor perimeter
shalt be supported by framing members or solid blocking.

j. Where a rafter is fastened to an adjacent paraflel ceiling joist in accordance with this schedule, provide two toe nails on one side of the rafter and toe nails

from the ceiling joist to top plate in accordance with this schedule. The toe nail on the opposite side of the rafter shall not be required.

K. Use of Staples in braced well panels shall be prohibited in Seismic Design Category DG, D1, or D2.

2013 R6-02. Footnote “b” of Table R602.3(2) of the 2013 Edition of the California Residential
Code is amended to read as follows:

b. Staples shall have a minimum crown width of 7/16-inch on diameter except as noted. Use of
staples in roof, floor, subfloor, and braced wall panels shall be prohibited in Seismic Design

Category Dy, Dy, or D,.




2013 R6-03. Table R602.10.3(3) of the 2013 Edition of the California Residential Code is
amended to read as follows:

<

TABLE R602.10.3(3)
BRACING REQUIREMENTS BASED ON SEISMIC DESIGN CATEGORY
SOIL CLASS D°
WALL HEIGHT = 10 FEET
PSF DEA MINIMUM TOTAL LENGTH (FEET) OF BRACED WALL PANELS
10 FLOOR D LOAD REGUIRED ALONG EACH BRACED WALL LINE*

15 PSF ROOF/CEILING DEAD LOAD
BRACED WALL LINE SPACING < 26 FEET

Methods
e Story Location Emg MethodLiB° | Mothod GB & g‘gg’g’ggf Mathod m
{foet) HPS, C8.8FB*.L G
10 25 23 75 16 14
2 50 50 5.0 32 27
30 75 75 75 48 41
40 100 10.0 100 64 54
50 125 125 125 80 68
10 NP 45 45 30 26
20 NP 0.0 9.0 60 5.1
(mwnh‘fm only} 3 NP 135 135 90 77
40 NP 18.0 180 12,0 10.2
50 NP 25 25 150 128
10 NP 6.0 6.0 45 38
20 NP 120 12.0 90 77
30 NP 120 12.0 135 115
40 NP 240 240 180 153
50 NP 300 300 25 19.1
10 NP 2856 2% 56| 18 16
20 NP $5110] -S5110| 36 3.1
&) NP —%3-188| 83188 54 46
40 NP 020  He-20 72 6.1
50 NP 438278| 438228 90 77
10 NP 3w S3-w | 38 32
2 NP 195N 195-0 | 75 64
D, 0 NP 458-mp 458 | 113 96
40 NP 200 | 210w | 150 128
50 NP 2630 | 263 188 160
10 NP 3w | Fw 53 45
20 NP S5 | S | 105 90
k) NP 248 | 2+8-w | 158 134
40 NP 299w | 298w | 210 179
50 NP 363 NP =363 NP 26.3 23

fcontinued}




TABLE R602.10.3(3)—continued
BRACING REQUIREMENTS BASED ON SEISMIC DESIGN CATEGORY

" SOLCLASSDF
«  WALL HEIGHT = 10 FEET
. BERGET. , T T
« BRACED WALL LINE SPACING < 2§ FEET «
Wethods
W Story Location Line ml':t;‘:‘;%: Method LiB* Mothod GB %:lggc;g,’ Method cswsp,
sFE'.L
0 NP 36 50| —S060] 20 7
20 NP £0-12.0 -66-12.0 440 34
30 NP 34-180| 46180 60 5.1
20 NP 126240 420240 80 68
50 NP +5-6- 30.0 +45.0-30.0 100 8.5
0 NP P NP| 60-Np| 43 i3
0 NP +6- NP -+28-NP 990 7.7
D, 30 NP 480 NP| 48O0-NP| 135 15
40 NP 248- NP 246-NP 18.0 183
50 NP 384 NP| 388NP 225 19.1
10 NP <35 NP —8—5—_N_P 60 54
2 NP 476~ NP|  478-NP{ 120 102
ki) NP 255 NP 255 NP 18.0 153
40 NP 348~ NP|  340-NP| 240 204
50 NP 425-NP| -425-NP| 300 255
0 NP 2501 46-80| 25 71
20 NP #0160 -80-160 50 43
30 NP 426-240| 428240 75 64
40 NP 166-320| 468320 100 85
50 NP -26:6-40.0 -28:6-40.0) 125 16.6
10 NP F5Np | F5NP| 55 a7
2 NP +56-NP | +456NP| 110 94
30 NP 225 NP 22.5-NP 16.3 140
40 NP 38546 NP 380-NP 2290 18.7
D 30 NP 375 NP 375 NP 215 234
2 10 NP NP NP NP NP
20 NP NP NP NP NP
40 NP NP NP NP NP
50 NP NP NP NP NP
10 NP NP NP 75 64
Crionle wall bel 20 NP NP NP 150 12.8
one- or‘ﬁw:fz;y dw:;ling 30 Np NP NP 25 19.1
40 NP NP NP 300 255
50 NP NP NP 375 39

For 81 1 inch = 25.4 mm, 1 foot = 305 mm, ¥ pound per square foot = 0.0479 kPa.

. Linear interprdation shall be permitted.

b. Wall bracing lengths are based on a soil xite class “D.” Interpolation of bracing length between the S, values associated with the Seismic Design Cateporics
shall be permitted when a site-specific 8, value is determined in accordance with Section 1613.3 of the International Building Code.

¢. Method L3 shall have gypsum board fastened fo at least one side with nails or screws per Table R602.3(1) for exterior sheathing or Table R7023.5 for
interior gypsum bosrd. Spacing of fasteners at panel edges shall not exceed 8 inches.

d. Method CS-3FB applies in SDC € only.

e. Methods GB and PCP braced wall panel hiw ratio shall not exceed 1:1 in SDC DO, D1 or D2. Methods DWB, SFB, PBS, and HPS are not premitted in SDC Do, D1,

or D2,




2013 R6-04. Table R602.10.4 of the 2013 Edition of the California Residential Code is amended
to read as follows:

< TABLE R802.104
BRACING METHODS !
CONNECTION CRITERIA®
METHODS, MATERIAL | MINIMUM THICKNESS FIGURE
Fastonors Spacing
1 x 4 wood or Woed: 2-8d commeon nails Wood: per stud and
approved metal straps _ or ) ) top and bottom plates
lm-i;: gacin at 45° to 60° angles for 3-8d (2Y, long x 0.113" dia.) nails
B maximum 16° Metal:
stud spacing Metal strap: per manufacturer per manufacturer
DWB %,"(1” nominal) for 2-8d ¢2'," loag x 0.113" dia.) nails
Diagonal maximum 247 or Per stud
wood boards stud spacing 2- 1%, tong staples
WwsP 8d common (21/2°0.131) nails -Ftesiorshesthingper- - .
Wood . /8" edae distance to panel edge ~ Table-RE62333- 67 edges 12” field
G = TN T - -
(See Secton RE0Y 1532 gocommon (2125013 nais  “interior sheathing per- Vaties-by-fustener—
wee Section — 3/8" edae distance to panel edoe ~FableREOZIcH-or ROGZI3}- 6" edees 12" ficld
O cdpes 1o M
BV-WSP*
Wood Structural 4" at punel edges
Panels with Sione 1 @ . i by - . F2 at intermediale
o Masoury Veneer 1 See Figure R602.10.6.5 8¢ common {2°/," x 0.131) nails supports 4* ai braced
3 {See Section wall panel end posts
£ R602.10.6.5)
= o . 1'7," long x 0,12 dia. (for 7,” thick
£ Structural 1" or V" for sheathing) 1/, long x 0.12" dia.
) fiberboard sheath- maximum 16" tfor 7/, thick sheathing) 3~ edges 6" ficld
oy ing 4 stud spacing galvanized roofing nails or 84 common
g g (2'," long x 0.131 " dia.) nails
! Nails or screws per Table R602.3(1) for |For all braced wall
GE exterior locations panel locations: 77
k-] Iy s (including &
Gypsum board : Nails or screws per Table RTU2.3.5 101 [ potorn placs) 3
interior locations field
oA 1 o
Particleboand Yy or iy for 2 g;:g!i Pytisarini e oducs 6 fi
sheathing “;a“;ﬁ:"mm For '7,”, 8d common 3" edges 67 ficld
{See Section R605) stud spacing 24,” long x 0,131~ dia) naits
PCP See Section R703.6 for 1’4" tong, 11 gage, 7" dia. head nails | . .
Portiand maximum 16" or * 6 G‘i‘;: all framing
cement plaster stud spacing *1,” long, 16 gage staples a mem
HPS 1y . 0.092" dia., 0.223" dia. head nails with
Hardboarg | e for fximum 16 length to accommedate 1'," 4" edges 8 field
panel siding stuc spacing penetration into studs
ABW See
N o . N
ﬁidmii:l l i See Section R602.10.6.1 Section R602.10.6.1

{continued}




TABLE R602.10.4—continyed

BRACING METHODS !
CONNECTION CRITERIA®
METHODS, MATERIAL MINIMUM THICKNESS FIGURE
Fastonors Spacing
§ PFH N
¥ Portal frame with s A See Section RHR.10.6.2 See Section R602.10.6.2
= hold-dowas
g
g
o
# PFG P - See Secti y ; See Secti
éé Portal frame at garage hr See Section R60U2.10.6.3 See Section R602.10.6.3
&
=4
-
8d common (2 142"x0.131) nails Fxmm&mg-pef— - -y
CS-WSP 348" edge distance to panel 6" edges 127 ficld
Continuously sheathed —ife-
wood structural panel v Blcommon1250i30ais *m"mf*‘*w —Varies by fastener—
3/3" edge distance to panel edge Fable REUZIEH-or REOZITY 6" edges 12" field —
cs-Gh*

Continuously sheathed

wond structural panel = See: Method CS-WSP See Method CS-WSP
@ | adjacent to garage 1532°
B openings =
g C5-PF "
“ 1 Continuously sheathed T See Section R602.10.6.4 See Section R602.10.6.4
E portal frame 1532
8 7 Tong x 0.12 dia.
=
g (for lq thick sheasthing)
¢ CS-SFB* ) or 84, for 1Y, long x 0.12" dia.

Continuously sheathed maximum 16" {for =1, thick sheathing) 3~ edges 6" field

structural fiberboard stud spacing galvanized roofing nails or
8d common
(24, tong x 0.131” dia.) nails

For SI: 1 inch = 25.4 mum, | foot = 305 mm, | degree = 0.0175 rad, 1 pound per square foot = 47.8 Ném?, | mile per hour = 0.447 m&s.

a. Adhesive attachment of wall sheathing, including Method G8, shall aot be permitied in Seismic Design Categories C, D, D, and D,

b. Applies to panels next to g door opening when supp g wable end wall or roof load oaly. May only be used on pne wall of the garage. 1n Seismic
Design Categories D, 13, and D D, roof covering g dead load may ot exceed 3 pst.

¢. Garage openings adjacent 10 a Method CS-G panel shall be provided with a header in accordance with Table R502.5(1). & full height clear opening shall not
be permvitted adjacent to 2 Method CS-G panel.

d. Method CS-SFB does not apply in Scismic Design Categories I, 1), and D, and in ancas where the wind speed exceeds 100 mph.

2. Method applics 1o detachiod one- and two-family dwellings in Seismic Design Categories D, through I, oaly.

1. Methods GB and PCP braced wall panel hiw ratio shall not exceed 1:1 in SDC DO, D1, or D2. Methods LIB, DWB, SFB, PBS, HPS, and PFG are not permitted in
SDC DO, D1, or D2.

¢. Use of staples in braced wall panels shall be prohibited in SDC DO, D1, or D2.




2013 R6-05. Figure R602.10.6.1 of the 2013 Edition of the California Residential Code is
amended to read as follows:

PANEL LENGTHPER

TOP PLATE SHALL BE CONTINUOUS

TABLE RaD2 108

OVER BRACED WALL PANEL

BRACED WALL PANEL HEIGHT

15i32"
HIN-38~WO0D

STRUCTURAL PANEL
SHEATHING ON ONE m;e——\\
MIN. 2 X4 FRAMING MIN

DOUBLE STUOS Rsau;as;\\

2YHOLO-DOWN OR {2} STRAP-TYPE
ANCHORS PER TABLE RE02.10.8.4 ¢
OF BACH SHOWN FOR CLARITY),
STRAP-TYPE ANCHORS BHALL BE
PERMITTED TO BE ATTACHED JYER
THE WOOD STRUCTURAL PANEL

PANEL MUST BE ATTACHED
TO CONCRETE FOOTING OR
CONCRETE FOUNDATION
WALL CONTINUDUS OVER
ERACED WALL LINE

@23 4Z DIAMETER ANCHOR

BOLYS LOCATED BETWEEN
" AND 13" OF EACH END OF
THE BEGHENT

FIGURE R602.10.6.1
METHOD ABW—ALTERNATE BRACED WALL PANEL

£OR PANEL SPLICE §F NEEDED)
ADJORING PAMEL EDGES SHALL MEET
OVER AND 8E FASTENEDQ TO CORMON
FRAMING

8D COMMON-OR-GALY-BOX-NALS G 8°
O.C AT PANEL EDGES. FOR SINGLE
STURY ANG & 4" 0.C. PANEL EDGES
FOR THE FIRST OF 2 8TORIES

BTUDS UNDER HEADER AS REQUIRED

S0 COMMON-GRGALV-BOX NALS @ 12°
3.C, AT INTERIOR SUPPORTS

MIN. REIMFORCING OF FOUNDATION,
ONE #4 BAR TOP AND BOTTOM. LAP
BARS 45-MININUN,

2£

RINIMUK FOQTING SIZE UNDER
GPEMING 15 127 X 12° A FURNED-DOWN-

“SHAS-SHACBE-PERMTTEEAT-DOOR-
-OPENINGE—




2013 R6-06. Figure R602.10.6.2 of the 2013 Edition of the California Residential Code is
amended to read as follows:

Lo
(s XTENT OF HE ADE & WITH DOUBLE PORTAL FRANES TWO BRACED WALL PANELS)
—ENTENTOEHEADERWATH-SINGLE-RORTAL ER AL
E——— BN AAC-PANE - ————
210 FINISHED WIDTH OF OPENING
£OR SNGLE OR DOUBLE PORTAL
TEN SION STRAR PR M
PoNYWAL THBLE RE02.10.8.4 (0N
NEIGHT OPPOSITE SI0E OF
SHEATHING)
1 HEZUED, PAREL
. MG 10 HEADER WITH 20 SPUCE EDGES SHALL N
FASTEN SHEATHING H R GOCUR OVER AND BE
7 %’, CONMON DR GALVANIZED BOX NAILS I 3* ORI NALED TO CONUON ;ﬁg’g”
£ o FATTE RN AS SHOWR BLOCKING WITHIN HEADER WITH
4 *OF Wi
2 M HEADER YO JACK STUD STRAP PER TABLE et o
4 e R&DZ 1054 ON BOTH SIDES OF OPE RING ROWOP Y O.L ROWS OF 160
3 b GHBOSITE SIDE OF SHEATHING ARG 18 REQUREED SINKER NAILS &Y
k g i 3°0.CTVR.
2 H b 8 EACK PAREL EDGE.
1582
.O_ > by RN, OOUBLE 2X6 FRAMING COVERED WATH Nt N MIN. IBENOOD
% b4 g 15/32" -HELTHIC K WOOT STRUCTURAL PANEL SHEATHING TYPICALPORTAL L d STRUCTURAL
s 3o WITH 80 COMY O OR GALVANIZED BOXNAILS AT FRAME CONSTRUCTION PAREL
A < 2°0.C. I ALL FRAMING (TUDS, BLOCKING, AKD SHEATHING
SHLSTYP.
SR BURLE - PASE
SN, LENGTH OF PAREL PER TARLE RAO2 108 HNGANDAC K-SR
HHMBER-OSARK-GTUBS
NN, (234200 LB STRAP.TYRE HOLDDOWNS @
(EMBEDOED W TO CONCRETE AND NAILED INTO
ERANING)
N, REINFORCING OF FOUNDATION, GNE $48AR 100 ]
TOP AKD BOTTOM OF FOOTING . LAP BORS 45~ Cx o g bt
My 20 5 -BEVICEEMBEBDEG O ‘
' O RRAMING-
N 4 FODTING SIZE UNDER CRENING 15127 X 12° A TLNED
DOWN SLAB SHALL BE PERMITTED AT DOCR OPENIGS.
M. (1) S8 DIANETER ANCROR BOLT INSTALLED PER
R403.1 6 - WITH 2" X 2° X 318" PLATEWA SHER
FRONT ELEVATION SECTION
FIGURE R602.10.6.2

METHOD PFH—PORTAL FRAME WITH HOLD-DOWNS
AT DETACHED GARAGE DOOR OPENINGS




2013 R6-07. Table R602.10.5 of the 2013 Edition of the California Residential Code is amended
to read as follows:

TABLE R602.10.5
MINIMUM LENGTH OF BRACED WALL PANELS
MINIMUM LENGTH"
(inchoe)
METHOD CONTRIBUTING LENGTH
{See Table R602.10.4) Wall Haight {inches)
8 foet 9 fout 10 foet 11fent | 12fent
DWB, WSP, SFB, PBS, PCP, HPS, BV-WSP 48 48 48 53 58 Actual®
cn a8 | a8 | s | s | s Sigﬁzzfi;,‘dj‘}gﬁﬁﬁm
LiB 35 62 &9 NP NP Actual®
SDCA, B and C, ® | o3 | M | 8 | 4
ABW w;rsgp;edl; ;:;:: ;I)lph 48
wind spc';d é 110 m?:oh 2 2 H NP NP
P Supporting roof only 4624 4624|624 | 24T 20024 48
Supporting one story androof | 24 24 4 r oy 48
G 24 27 30 33 3¢ 1.5 x Actual®
Cs-G 24 27 kY i3 36 Actual®
CS-PF 624 H8-24) 20-24) 22247 W Actual®
Adjacent clear opening height
{inches)y
<64 4 27 30 3 36
68 26 27 30 KX} 36
72 27 27 3 33 36
76 30 29 30 33 36
80 32 30 30 33 36
84 35 32 R 33 36
’8 38 35 33 33 36
92 43 37 35 35 36
96 48 41 8 36 36
CS-WSP, {5-5FB we e 44 40 38 8
ws e 49 43 40 3 Actual®
108 — 54 46 43 41
12 — — 50 45 43
16 — — 55 48 45
126 — — &) 52 48
124 — e — 56 51
128 — e — 61 54
132 —_ o o 66 38
136 e o — o 62
140 e — — — 66
144 e e — — 72

For SE 1 inch = 25.4 mm, 1 foot = 304.8 mm, | mile per hour = 0.447 mis.

NP = Not Permitted.

a. Linear interpolation shal be permitted.

b, Use the actual fength when it is greater than or equal to the minimum length.

¢. Maximum header height for PFH is 10 feet in accordance with Figure R602.10.6.2, but wall beight may be increased to 12 feet with posy wall.

d. Maximum opening height for PFG is 10 feet in accordance with Figure R602.10.6.3, but wall height may be increased to 12 feet with pony wall.
¢, Maximum opening height for CS-PFis 11 feet in acoordance with Figure RE02.11.6.4, but wall height may be increased to 12 feet with pony wall.




2013 R6-08. Section R602.10.2.3 of the 2013 Edition of the California Residential Code is
amended to read as follows:

R602.10.2.3 Minimum number of braced wall panels. Braced wall lines with a length of 16
feet (4877 mm) or less shall have a minimum of two braced wall panels of any length or one
braced wall panel equal to 48 inches (1219 mm) or more. Braced wall lines greater than 16 feet
(4877 mm) shall have a minimum of two braced wall panels. No braced wall panel shall be less
than 48 inches in length in Seismic Design Category Dy, D4, or Ds.

2013 R6-09. Figure R602.10.6.4 of the 2013 Edition of the California Residential Code is
amended to read as follows:

e ESCTENET OF SEAUER SCPHR SOUBLE PORTAL FRAMES (TG BRACEN WALL PaNELY

EXTRNT OF SEAQER WITH SHOUS FORTAL FAANE
[o—n—— LORE BRACED WALL PASEL) ——

2 I FINSHED WIDTROF OPERNG
FORUNGLE OR DOUMLE PORTAL

[rm—

PO WALk ¥ H ’
[ i
{
i
}
i FASTEN SHEATHING TO HEADER WITH 30 T s
= ‘}: TOMMON OR GAVARLIES BOX HALS N I° GRO H i FASTENR TOPSLATE TO
& : PATTERN AS SHOWN : i HEADER WITH TWO
g X i i ROWS OF 19C SNHER
= i Hs NALS ATF 0L, TYO,
1 HEAGES TOJACHOIUD STNAR BER TABRE  rnns” H 3
L1 AS02.101 4 ON HOTH MIDES DF OPERNG { i
: 5 I CPROMITE TICHE OF SHEATHRG ; LOMMDN RLOCKING i
K : 3 ! YT 2 OF WALL . 15 16/32"
@& & O ! 4D~ HEIGHT. ONE ROW 14 »
) g [+ BN, DOUBLE 2564 FRAMNG GOVERED WITH UN, ; OF M08 NMUNE 1S ond e OB, FEWOCD
Z 3 H 1507 HETHSKNOOD SYRUCTURAL FANEL ! REDURED § £A0% R [ BTRUCTURAL PANEL
. & I K SHTATHING WITH B SOMBION TR CALYARRED i PANELEDGE. 4 SHEATHING
: BOX NALS AT Q0. I ALk FRAMING (BTUDR., ; i1
BLOCKING, A48T SLS} TrR. H 15.
i : TYMICAL PORTAL i
FAN. LENGTH OF PAIEL FER TABLE RE02.10.8 "?‘\\ H FAAMECCHETRUCTION i3
N, (23 12 DIAMETER ANCHOR BOLTS i \ potT i3
kb H o e i
BETALED PER RAVZ L8 WHTH 2B B PAATE § e e
WARHER : 2 PRI AND JACK BTOD. s
K FX3%0.229" P HnaE OF AcK i A
A s
T § . RN AL * »
4 AR i
b 5o ¥ S 0 -y ¥ s !
[ R 2 S « . - - N . - \:: v N i
\____ ARCHON BOLTS PRR
OVER CONCRETE OR MASORRY S1LOCK FOUNDADON FECTION MK 18
] s FrasmG ancroRs
WOOH FTAUCTURAL AANEL NAR BOLEMATE APPLED

NAL FOUE

ACRDSS
SHEATHING TG TOP OF BARD OR SHESATINGIUNTWITR A

TRIET PER

TARLE ROOT A1} CHRRCATY QF 432 (B8 PLATR 1O SOIST
THE RORIZONTAL AR PER TARLE
VERNCAL DIRECTIONS ROOIY

- 00D STRUGTIRETPRAEL SHEATHING OVER ARG bt
OVER RAISED WOOD FLOOR . FRAMING AHCHOR OPTION

SHHER PORTAL SHEATHNG DCEG NOT LAF OVER BT O 81 5081

ih
: WOOD STRUCTURAL
b PANEL SREATIING
CONTHUOUS CHRR SR
R N SCHRY
ok /

1
\‘-—— WODE STRUC TURAL PANEL SHRATHNG DVER APPROVED 88N0 OR Ril JORT

B DRND OF B JCRY

NANL SORE

TARL g PLATE TOIOST
HE RSAENG PERT)

ROVERN

A BAND
£

RAISER WOOD FLOOR - OVERLAP OPTION
TWIHER PORTAL BAEATHING LARS DVER RARD OR RIS AOART)

FRONT ELEVATION SECTION
For $1: 1 inch =254 mm, 1 foot = 304.8 mm.

FIGURE R602.10.6.4
METHOD CS-PF-CONTINUOUSLY SHEATHED PORTAL FRAME PANEL CONSTRUCTION




2013 R6-10. Section R602.10.9.1 of the 2013 Edition of the California Residential Code is
deleted in its entirety:

2013 R6-11. Section R606.2.4 of the 2013 Edition of the California Residential Code is
amended to read as follows:

R606.2.4 Parapet walls. Unreinforced solid masonry parapet walls shall not be less than 8
inches (203 mm) thick and their height shall not exceed four times their thickness. Unreinforced
hollow unit masonry parapet walls shall be not less than 8 inches (203 mm) thick, and their
height shall not exceed three times their thickness. Masonry parapet walls in areas subject to
wind loads of 30 pounds per square foot (1.44 kPa)_or located in Seismic Design Category Dy,
D, or D,, or on townhouses in Seismic Design Category C shall be reinforced in accordance
with Section R606.12.

2013 R6-12. Section R606.12.2.2.3 of the 2013 Edition of the California Residential Code is
amended to read as follows:

R606.12.2.2.3 Reinforcement requirements for masonry elements. Masonry elements listed
in Section R606.12.2.2.2 shall be reinforced in either the horizontal or vertical direction as
shown in Figure R606-1+H2)R606.11(3) and in accordance with the following:

1. Honzontal relnforcement Horlzontal Jomt remforcement shaII con5|st of atJeasttwo

Horlzontal remforcement shall be prowded W|th|n 16
inches (406 mm) of the top and bottom of these masonry elements.

2. Vertical reinforcement. Vertical reinforcement shall consist of at least one No. 4 bar
spaced not more than 48 inches (1219 mm). Vertical reinforcement shall be within 46-8
inches (406mm) of the ends of masonry walls.

2013 R6-13. Exception of Section R602.3.2 of the 2013 Edition of the California Residential
Code is amended to read as follows:




Exception: Aln_other than Seismic Design Category D, Dy or D,, a single top plate may be

installed in stud walls, provided the plate is adequately tied at joints, corners and interesting
walls by a minimum 3-inch-by-6-inch by a 0.036-inch-thick (76 mm by 152 mm by 0.914 mm)
galvanized steel plate that is nailed to each wall or segment of wall by six 8d nails on each side,
provided the rafters or joists are centered over the studs with a tolerance of no more than 1 inch
(25 mm). The top plate may be omitted over lintels that are adequately tied to adjacent wall
sections with steel plates or equivalent as previously described.

2013 R8-01. Section R803.2.4 is added to Chapter 8 of the 2013 Edition of the California
Residential Code to read as follows:

R803.2.4 Openings_in_horizontal diaphragms. Openings in horizontal diaphragms shall
conform with Section R503.2.4.

2013 R10-01. Section R1001.3.1 of the 2013 Edition of the California Residential Code is
amended to read as follows:

R1001.3.1 Vertical reinforcing. For chimneys up to 40 inches (1016 mm) wide, four No. 4
continuous vertical bars_adequately anchored into the concrete foundation shall be placed
between wythes of solid masonry or within the cells of hollow unit masonry and grouted in
accordance with Section R609. Grout shall be prevented from bonding with the flue liner so that
the flue liner is free to move with thermal expansion. For chimneys more than 40 inches (1016
mm) wide, two additional No. 4 vertical bars adequately anchored into the concrete foundation
shall be provided for each additional flue incorporated into the chimney or for each additional 40
inches (1016 mm) in width or fraction thereof.”

GREEN BUILDING STANDARDS CODE AMENDMENTS
“§ 15.04.450 CHAPTER 1 AMENDED - ADMINISTRATION

2013 G1-01. Section 101.12 is added to the 2013 Edition of the California Green Building
Standards Code to read as follows:

101.12 Fee for Mandatory Measures. A fee of ten percent (10%) of the plan check/permit fee
shall be assessed to verify compliance with the mandatory measure of the California Green
Building Standards Code.

2013 G1-02. Section 101.12.1 is added to the 2013 Edition of the California Green Building
Standards Code to read as follows:

101.12.1 Fee for Tier Measures. When Tier 1 or Tier 2 measures need to be verified by the
enforcing agency, an additional ten percent (10%) of the plan check/permit fee may be
assessed.

2013 G2-01. Section 202 of the 2013 Edition of the California Green Building Standards Code is
amended to read as follows:

SUSTAINABILITY. Consideration of present development and construction impacts on the
community, the economy. and the environment without compromising the needs of the future.

2013 G3-01. Section 301.1 of the 2013 Edition of the California Green Building Standards Code
is amended to read as follows:




301.1 Scope. Buildings shall be designed to include the green building measures specified as

mandatory in-the-application-checklists-contained-in this code. *
“§ 15.04.450 CHAPTER 4 AMENDED - RESIDENTIAL MANDATORY MEASURES.

2013 G3-02. Section 301.1.1 of the 2013 Edition of the California Green Building Standards
Code is amended to read as follows:

Section 301.1.1 Additions and alterations. [HCD] The mandatory provisions of Chapter 4
shaII be applled to addltlons or alteratlons of exustlng reS|dent|aI buﬂdmgs—where—the—addmens-er

to addltlons and alteratlons shall only applv to the portlons of the buulqu being added or altered
within the scope of the permitted work.

2013 G5-01. Section 5.408.3 of the 2013 Edition of the California Green Building Standards
Code is amended to read as follows:

5.408.3 Excavated soil and land clearing debris [BSC] 100 percent of trees, stumps, rocks
and associated vegetation and soils resulting primarily from land clearing shall be reused or
recycled. For a phased project, such material may be stockpiled on site until the storage site is
developed.

Exception: Reuse, either on-or off-site, of vegetation or soil contaminated by disease or
pest infestation.

Notes:

1. If contamination by disease or pest infestation is suspected, contact the County
Agricultural Commissioner and follow its direction for recycling or disposal of the
material. (www.cdfa.ca.gov/exec/ county/county_contacts.html)

2. For a map of known pest and/or disease quarantine zones, consult with the
California Department of Food and Agriculture. (www.cdfa.ca.gov)

3. Contaminated soil shall not be reused and shall be disposed of or remediated in
accordance with relevant requlations.

2013 G6-01. Section 601.1 is added to the 2013 Edition of the California Green Building
Standards Code to read as follows:

601.1. This section lists the organization and standards that are referenced in various sections
of this document. The standards are listed herein by the promulgating agency of the standard.

2013 GA4-07. Section A4.405.4 of the 2013 Edition of the California Green Building Standards
Code is amended to read as follows:

A4.405.4 Use of building materials from rapidly renewable sources. One or more of the
following materials manufactured from rapidly renewable sources or agricultural by-products is
used_for a minimum of 2.5 percent of the total value, based on estimated cost of materials on

the project:




Insulation

Bamboo or cork

Engineered products

Agricultural based products

Other products acceptable to the enforcing agency

abhwON =

Note: The intent of this section is to utilize building materials and products which are
typically harvested within a 10-year or shorter cycle

2013 GA4-08. Section A4.407.1 of the 2013 Edition of the California Green Building Standards
Code is amended to read as follows:

A4.407.1 Drainage around foundations. Install foundation and landscape drains which
discharge to a dry well, sump, bioswale or other approved on-site location_except when not

required by state code or locally approved ordinance.

2013 GA4-09. Sections A4.408.1 and A4.408.1.1 of the 2013 Edition of the California Green
Building Standards Code is amended to read as follows:

A4.408.1 Enhanced construction waste reduction. Nonhazardous construction and
demolition debris generated at the site is diverted to recycle or salvage in compliance with one
of the following:

Tier 1. At least a 65 percent reduction

Tier 2. At least a 75 percent reduction

2013 GA5-01. Section A5.106.4.1 of the 2013 Edition of the California Green Building
Standards Code is amended to read as follows:

A5.106.4.1 Reserved-Short-term bicycle parking. If the project is_anticipated to generate
visitor traffic, provide permanently anchored bicycle racks within 200 feet of the visitors’
entrance, readily visible to passers-by, for 15 percent of visitor motorized vehicle parking
capacity, with a minimum of one two-bike capacity rack.

2013 GA5-02. Table A5.106.4.3 of the 2013 Edition of the California Green Building Standards
Code is amended to read as follows:




A5.106.4.3 Changing rooms. For buildings with over 10 tenant-occupants, provide
changing/shower facilities for tenant-occupants only in accordance with Table A5.106.4.3 or
document arrangements with nearby changing/shower facilities.

~ TABLE A5.106.4.3 , o
NUMBER 2-TIER (12" X 15" X
OF SHOWER/CHANGING 72") PERSONAL
TENANT- | FACILITIES REQUIRED* EFFECTS |
0-10 0 1_unisex shower 1
,,,,,,,,, 11,;50”"”77 1 1 unisex showerlﬂ ' 2
77777 51-100 1 unisex shower ] 3
101-200 1 shower stall per gender 4
Over 200 | 1 shower stall per gender for, One 2-tier locker for
each 200 additional tenant- | each 50 additional
occupants . tenant-occupants

Note: Additional information on recommended bicycle accommodations may be
obtained from Sacramento Area Bicycle Advocates

2013 GA5-03. Section A5.106.6.1 of the 2013 Edition of the California Green Building
Standards Code is amended to read as follows:

A5.106.6.1 Reduce parking capacity. With the approval of the enforcement authority, employ
strategies to reduce on-site parking area by 20% by

1. Use of on street parking or compact spaces, illustrated on the site plan or

2. Implementation and documentation of programs that encourage occupants to carpool,
ride share or use alternate transportation.

Note: Strategies for programs may be obtained from local TMAs.

2013 GA5-04. Section A5.106.11.2, Table A5.106.11.2.2 and Table A5.106.11.2.3 of the 2013
Edition of the California Green Building Standards Code are amended to read as follows:

A5.106.11.2 Cool Roof for reduction of heat island effect. Use roofing materials having a
minimum aged solar reflectance and thermal emittance complying with Sections A5.106.11.2.1
and A5.106.11.2.2 or a minimum aged Solar Reflectance Index (SRI) complying with Section
A5.106.11.2.3 and as shown in Table A5.106.11.2. 2 for Tier 1 or Table A5.106.11.2.3 for Tier




TABLE A5.106.11.2.2 [BSC] u
TIER 1

MINIMUM 3-YEAR
ROOF | CLIMATE | AGED SOLAR THERMAL
SLOPE ZONE REFLECTANCE | EMITTANCE | SRI
1712:12 1-16 0-65 0.63 0.75 64 82 |
1212 1-16 0.20 0.75 46 27

TABLE A5.106.11.2.3
TIER 2
MINIMUM 3-YEAR
ROOF | CLIMATE | AGED SOLAR | THERMAL
SLOPE | ZONE | REFLECTANCE | EMITTANCE | SRI
U212 | 1-16 06.65 0.68 0.85 7885
1212 | 1-16 0.300.28 0.85 3035

2013 GA5-05. Section A5.406.1 of the 2013 Edition of the California Green Building Standards
Code is amended to read as follows:

A5.406.1 Choice of materials. Compared to other products in a given product category,
choose materials proven to be characterized by one or more of the following_for a minimum of 5
percent of the total value, based on estimated cost of materials on the project.

Section 2. Chapter 15.20 (“Fire Code’) of the Monrovia Municipal Code is hereby
amended as follows. Existing Monrovia Municipal Code Sections un-changed by this Ordinance
shall remain in effect, with the exception of existing references to previous editions of the codes
referenced, which are hereby repealed and replaced with the editions adopted by reference in

this Ordinance:

“§ 15.20.010 FIRE CODE ADOPTED.

(A) With the exception of the additions, deletions and amendments set forth in this Chapter,
Part 9 of Title 24 of the California Code of Regulations, comprising the California Fire Code
2040 2013 Edition, which incorporates and amends the International Fire Code 2008 2012
Edition, published by the International Code Council, including Appendices Chapter 4, and B, C,
D, E, F, G, H | and K threugh-J and the International Fire Code standards, is hereby adopted by
reference as the Fire Code of the City.

(B) A copy of such code has been deposited in the office of the City Clerk and shall be at all
times maintained by the City Clerk for use and examination by the public.”

“§ 15.20.020 PURPOSE.

The purpose of this code is to establish the minimum requirements consistent with nationally
recognized good practice for providing a reasonable level of life safety and property protection
from the hazards of fire, explosions or dangerous conditions in new and existing buildings,
structures and premises and to provide safety to firefighters and emergency responders during




emergency operations. The titles to the various secondary codes listed in § 15.20.010 indicate
more particularly the specific purposes contributing to the safeguarding of life and property from
the hazards of fire and explosion.”

“§ 15.20.030 SUBSTITUTION OF TERMS. <

The following words and phrases used in the Fire Code shall have the meanings set forth below
whenever used in this Chapter:

For the word or phrase: Substitute:

City, agency or municipality: City of Monrovia
Legislative body: City Council

Fire Department: City of Monrovia Fire Department
Chief: Fire Chief of the Monrovia Fire Department
Fire Code Official: Chief or his/her appointee”

“§ 15.20.040 SECTION 103.4 OF CHAPTER 1 AMENDED—NON-LIABILITY OF CITY OR
OFFICIAL.

Section 103.4 of Chapter 1 of the Fire Code is hereby amended by adding an opening
paragraph to read as follows:

This Code shall not be construed to hold the City or any officer or employee of the City
responsible for any damage to persons or property by reason of the inspection or re-inspection
authorized herein or failure to inspect or re-inspect or the permit issued as herein provided or by
reason of the approval or disapproval of any equipment authorized herein.”

Section 108.1 of Chapter 1 of the Fire Code is hereby amended to read as follows:

Appeals to Planning Commission. Whenever the Chief disapproves an application or refuses to
grant a license or permit applied for, or when it is claimed that the provisions of the code do not
apply or that the true intent and meaning of the Code has been misconstrued or wrongly
interpreted, the applicant may appeal from the decision of the Chief of the fire department to the
Planning Commission of the City of Monrovia, as set forth in Section 2.52.060 of the Monrovia
Municipal Code, within thirty days from the date of the decision of the Chief.”

“15.20.060 SECTION 104.1 OF CHAPTER 1 AMENDED—PROSECUTION OF ARSON
STATUTE.

Section 104.1 of Chapter 1 of the Fire Code is hereby amended to read as follows:

The Fire Code Official is hereby authorized for the apprehension and prosecution of anyone
suspected of violating any fire law or arson statute, to enforce the provisions of this Code and
shall have the authority to render interpretations of this Code, and to adopt policies, procedures,
rules and regulations in order to clarify the application of its provisions. Such interpretations,
policies, procedures, rules and regulations shall be in compliance with the intent and purpose of
this Code and shall not have the effect of waiving requirements specifically provided for in this
Code.”

“§ 16.20.070 SECTION 103.3 OF CHAPTER 1 AMENDED—PERSONNEL POWERS.




Section 103.3 of Chapter 1 of the Fire Code is hereby amended by changing the title to read
"Fire prevention bureau and arson investigation unit personnel and police” and to read as

follows:

In accordance with the prescribed procedures of this jurisdiction and with the concurrence of the
appointing authority, the Chief shall have the authority to appoint fire prevention personnel and
arson investigators. Members of the arson investigation unit shall, complete the requirements
set forth in California Penal Code section 832 and have the powers of a police officer in
performing their duties.”

“§ 15.20.075 SECTION 105.6.27 AMENDED-LP-GAS.

Section 105.6.27 of the Fire Code is hereby amended to read as follows:

An operational permit is required for :

1.Storage and use of LP-gas on land zoned "manufacturing”.
Exception: A permit is not required for individual containers with a 500-gallon
(1893 L) water capacity or less or multiple container systems having an
aggregate guantity not exceeding 500-gallons (1893 L), used exclusively for
emergency power generation serving Group R-3 occupancies not located in the
Wildland-Urban Interface area.

2.0Operation of cargo tankers that transport LP-gas.”

“§ 15.20.080 SECTION 307.1.1 AMENDED-PROHIBITED OPEN BURNING.

Section 307.1.1 of the Fire Code is hereby amended to read as follows:
Prohibited open burning.

Open burning that is offensive or objectionable because of smoke emissions or when
atmospheric conditions or local circumstances make such fires hazardous shall be prohibited.
No person shall dispose of any combustible waste material by burning, or kindle or maintain any
bonfire, rubbish fire, incinerator, or other outside non-permitted fireplace or chimney, or
authorize any such fire to be kindled or maintained on any lot or parcel of land within the city
without a written permit from the Chief of the fire department.”

“§15.20.090 CHAPTER 5 SECTIONS 503.2.1 AMENDED-DIMENSIONS ANB-603-3.

Fire Apparatus Access Roads 503.2.1 Dimensions

503.2.1 is amended and Table 503.2.1-A is added to the California Fire Code to read in their
entirety as follows:

503.2.1 Private roads used for fire apparatus access. The minimum width of private roads which
are also used for fire apparatus access shall be in accordance with Table 503.2.1-A. The
minimum required width for fire apparatus access should not be used to determine the minimum
width of private roads. When approved by the chief this requirement may be modified or waived.
Table 503.2.1-A. Minimum Width of Private Roads Also Used for Fire Apparatus Access

Location of Parking Minimum Road Width
Parking not permitted on road 25 20
Parking permitted on one side only 28 26
Parking permitted on both sides 34 32




private-property-SECTION 503.2.4 AMENDED - TURNING RADIUS

Section 503.2.4 of the Fire Code is hereby amended to read as follows:

Turning radius. Fire apparatus access roads shall have a minimum 38-foot (11590 mm)
centerline radius [28-foot (8540 mm) inside radius, 48-foot (14640 mm) outside radius] on
curves.”

“§ 15.20.110 RESERVED: SECTION 503.3 AMENDED - FIRE LANE MARKING/SIGNAGE.

Section 503.3 of the Fire Code is hereby amended to read as follows:

Fire Lane Marking/Signage. The designation shall be indicated:

(1) By a sign posted immediately adjacent to, and visible from, the designated place clearly
stating in letters not less than one inch in height that the place is a fire lane:

(2) By outlining or painting the place in red and, in contrasting color, marking the place with the
words "FIRE LANE", which are clearly visible from the vehicle, or

(3) By a red curb or red paint on the edge of the roadway upon which clearly marked the words
"FIRE LANE". The Chief shall have the authority to designate fire apparatus access roads on
private property.”

§ 15.20.130 RESERVED- SECTION 903.2 AMENDED - AUTOMATIC SPRINKLER SYSTEMS.
Section 903.2 of the Fire Code is hereby amended to read as follows:

“§ 15.20.140 SECTION-903-2- AMENDED—AUTOMATIC-SPRINKLER-SYSTEMS.




¢ fire_| | il losion.
SECTION 903.2.18 AMENDED—GROUP U PRIVATE GARAGES AND CARPORTS

ACCESSORY TO GROUP R-3 OCCUPANCIES.

Section 903.2.18 of the Fire Code is hereby amended to read as follows:

Carports with habitable space above, detached private garages over 1000 square feet in area,
and attached private garages shall be protected by fire sprinklers in accordance with this
section. These areas shall have a design density of an Ordinary Hazard Group 1 occupancy
with a design area of two (2) heads. Quick-response intermediate temperature commercial type
heads shall be used.”

“§ 15.20.150 SECTION 903.3.1.2 AMENDED - NFPA 13R SPRINKLER SYSTEM.

Section 903.3.1.2 of the Fire Code is hereby amended to read as follows:

Where allowed in buildings of Group R, up to and including buildings four stories in height,
automatic sprinkler systems shall be installed throughout in accordance with NFPA 13R with the
following additions:

(a) Attics shall be fully sprinklered with quick-response intermediate temperature heads.

(b) Private garages shall be sprinklered and shall have a design density of an Ordinary Hazard
Group 1 occupancy with a design area of two (2) heads. Quick-response intermediate
temperature commercial type heads shall be used for the garage area.”

“§ 15.20.160 SECTION 903.3.1.3 AMENDED - NFPA 13D SPRINKLER SYSTEM.

Section 903.3.1.3 of the Fire Code is hereby amended to read as follows:

Where allowed in buildings of Group R, automatic sprinkler systems shall be installed
throughout in accordance with NFPA 13D with the following additions:

(a) Attics containing forced air units shall have one or more quick-response intermediate
temperature sprinkler heads adjacent to each unit.

(b) Private garages shall be sprinklered and shall have a design density of an Ordinary Hazard
Group 1 occupancy with a design area of two (2) heads. Quick-response intermediate
temperature commercial type heads shall be used for the garage area.

(c) Attics and basements used for storage purposes shall be fully sprinklered with residential
type heads.

(d) A single exterior bell activated by the waterflow switch shall be provided at an approved
location.”

“§ 15.20.170 SECTION 903.6 1103.5 AMENDED - AUTOMATIC SPRINKLER SYSTEMS IN
EXISTING BUILDINGS.

Section 893-6 1103.5 of the Fire Code is hereby amended to read as follows:
An automatic fire sprinkler system shall be installed throughout the following existing buildings:

(a) Existing Group R, Division 1, 2, 2.1, 3, 3.1 or 34 Occupancies in which an addition of at least
50 percent of the existing square footage takes place.

(b) Commercial buildings over 5,000 square feet when an addition is made.




(c) Commerecial buildings under 5,000 square feet when an addition is made that will make the
total area greater than 5,000 square feet.

(d) In buildings with new occupancies.as required by other sections of the Fire Code.”
“§15.20.180 SECTIONS 603.8 AMENDED - INCINERATORS AND OPEN BURNING.

Section 603.8 of the Fire Code is hereby amended as follows:
Incinerators and open burning are prohibited except as provided under Section 307.1.”

“§ 15.20.190 SECTION 806.1.1. AMENDED - CHRISTMAS TREES.

Section 806.1.1 is hereby amended as follows:
806.1.1 Restricted occupancies. Natural cut trees shall be prohibited in Group A, E, I-1, 1-2, |-
2.1, -3, I-4, M, R-1, R-2 and R-4 occupancies.

EXCEPTIONS:
1. Trees located in areas protected by an approved automatic sprinkler system installed in
accordance with Section 903.3.1.1 or 903.3.1.2 shall not be prohibited in Group A, E, M, R-1,

and R-2.

2. Trees in unsprinklered areas of Group A, E, M, R-1 and R-2 occupancies when treated with a
flame retardant material that has been approved by the California State Fire Marshal. Each tree
treated with a flame retardant material shall bear a tag which shows the date treated, name of
the applicator, and the registration number of the flame retardant material.

3. Trees shall be allowed within dwelling units in Group R-2 occupancies.”

“§ 15.20.195 SECTION 806.1.4 ADDED - CHRISTMAS TREE LOTS.
Sections 806.1.4.1 - 806.1.4.11 are hereby amended and added as follows:
Permit and Plan.

806.1.4.1 A permit is required to establish, maintain or operate a Christmas tree lot. Application
for permlt shaII be submltted to the chief for approval Fer—Pemcutsier—G#mst—mas—'Free—l:ets—and

806.1.4.2 No person, including a holder of an un-revoked general merchandise license shall
operate a Christmas tree lot without a permit issued pursuant to this section. A permit shall not
be granted if the chief reasonably determines that the location or method of operation
endangers life or constitutes a fire hazard. A permit may be revoked if the provisions of these
sections are not met or maintained.

806.1.4.3 A permit granted pursuant to this section shall be valid from November 15th to
December 25th of the year in which the permit is issued.

806.1.4.4 An applicant for a permit shall submit a dimensional plot plan of the proposed location
with the application. The plot plan shall show the location of the Christmas trees, buildings,
trailers, tents, temporary structures, aisle widths, fenced areas, emergency exits and portable
fire extinguishers.

Location.




806.1.4.5 No person shall use any location for a Christmas tree lot where dry grass, weeds,
paper, combustible waste or other combustible materials exist.

806.1.4.6 Christmas trees shall not be located within 15 feet of any building, trailer, structure or
temporary building which is not necessary to the operation of the Christmas tree lot.

806.1.4.7 Christmas trees shall not be located within 25 feet of any facility where flammable or
combustible liquids are produced, stored, handled or dispensed.

Fire Protection.

806.1.4.8 Portable Fire Extinguisher. A minimum of (2) two 2A:10BC rated fire extinguishers
shall be provided. Travel distance to fire extinguishers shall not exceed 50 feet.
Sources of Ignition.

806.1.4.9 Smoking or open flames shall not be permitted upon any Christmas tree lot. Approved
"NO SMOKING" signs shall be posted as required.

806.1.4.10 An approved fused electrical source shall be provided. If extension cords are used,
they shall be a minimum size of 12-gauge wire, have grounding capabilities and be UL
(Underwriters Laboratories) approved for outdoor use. Extension cords shall be in good
condition without splices, deterioration or damage.

Closure of the Christmas Tree Lot.

806.1.4.11 On January 5th, following the permit period, all cut, natural Christmas trees,
combustible materials, tents, trailers, temporary buildings and structures associated with the
Christmas tree lot shall be removed and the location shall be cleaned to the reasonable
satisfaction of the Chief.”

“§ 15.20.240 SECTION 2206-2-3 2306.2.3 AMENDED CHAPRTER 22, SECTION-2206-2-3:1
AND-2206.2.3.2 ADDED - PROTECTED ABOVEGROUND TANKS.

Section 2206-2-3 2306.2.3 is hereby amended to read as follows:

2206-2.3 2306.2.3 Protected aboveground tanks. The storage and dispensing of Class |, Il, or
IIA liquid motor fuels into the fuel tank of a motor vehicle from protected aboveground tanks
located outside buildings shall be limited to fleet vehicle motor fuel-dispensing facilities except
as approved by the chief on a site specific basis.”

“§ 15.20.250 SECTION 33044 5601.1 AMENDED - LOCATIONS WHERE STORAGE OF
EXPLOSIVES AND BLASTING AGENTS ARE PROHIBITED.

Section 33644 5601.1 of the Fire Code is hereby amended to read as follows:

Storage of explosives and blasting agents is prohibited in all zones within the city, except
"manufacturing" zones as established by ordinance in the official land use plan for the City as
the same now exists or is hereafter amended.”

“§ 15.20.260 CHAPTER 33 56, SECTION 3309 5609 ADDED - SEIZURE OF FIREWORKS.

Section 3309 5609 is hereby added to read in its entirety as follows:




3309 5609 Seizure of Fireworks. All fireworks shall be illegal in the City of Monrovia including
California State Fire Marshal Safe and Sane. The fire code official shall have the authority to
seize, take and remove fireworks and/or safe and sane fireworks stored, sold, offered for sale,
used or handled in violation of the provisions of Title 19 CCR, Chapter 6 and Health and Safety
Code, Chapter 9. ..

EXCEPTION: When permits are issued for such use.”

“§ 15.20.270 SECTION 3404.2.9-5-1 5704.2.9.6.1 AMENDED - ESTABLISHMENT OF
LOCATIONS IN WHICH ABOVEGROUND STORAGE OF FLAMMABLE LIQUIDS AND BULK
PLANTS AND TERMINALS MAY BE PERMITTED.

Section 34042.9.51 5704.2.9.6.1 of the Fire Code is hereby amended as follows:

Locations where above ground tanks are prohibited. Storage of Class | and Class Il liquids in
aboveground tanks outside of buildings shall be permitted only on land zoned "manufacturing”
as established by ordinance in the official land use plan for the City, as the same now exists or
is hereafter amended, subject to the approval of the Fire Chief.”

“§ 15.20.280 SECTION 3406-4 5706.4 AMENDED - BULK PLANTS OR TERMINALS.

Section 3406-4 5706.4 of the Fire Code is hereby amended by adding a paragraph to read as
follows:

Bulk plants and terminals shall be permitted only on land zoned "manufacturing” as established
by ordinance in the official land use plan for the City, as the same now exists or is hereafter
amended, subject to approval of the Fire Chief.”

“§ 15.20.290 SECTION 3804-2 6104.2 AMENDED - ESTABLISHMENT OF LOCATIONS IN
WHICH STORAGE OF LIQUEFIED PETROLEUM GASES MAY BE PERMITTED.

Section 3804-2 6104.2 of the Fire Code is hereby amended by adding a paragraph to read as
follows: The storage of liquefied petroleum gases shall be permitted only on land zoned
"manufacturing” as established by ordinance in the official land use plan for the City, as the
same now exists or is hereafter amended, subject to the approval of the Fire Chief.
EXCEPTION: Individual containers with a 500-gallon (1893 L) water capacity or less or multiple
container systems having an aggregate quantity not exceeding 500-gallons (1893 L), used
exclusively for emergency power generation serving Group R-3 occupancies or other Other
locations as specifically approved by the Fire Chief.”

“§ 15.20.295 SECTION 6112 ADDED - USE OF LP-GAS FOR EMERGENCY POWER
GENERATION IN GROUP R-3 OCCUPANCIES IN THE WILDLAND-URBAN INTERFACE
AREA.

Section 6112 is hereby added to the Fire Code to read as follows: The use of liquefied
petroleum gas for emergency power generation for Group R-3 occupancies located in the
Wildiand-Urban Interface area shall comply with the following:

1.All individual containers shall be a maximum size of 500-gallon (1893 L) water
capacity. Multiple container systems shail not exceed 500-gallons (1893 L) in aggregate
quantity.

2. A minimum 10 foot setback shall be maintained between the tank and all buildings in
perpetuity. All future developments on the property shall be subject to this requirement.




3. Signage shall be provided on the tank indicating its contents and also warning of “NO

SMOKING WITHIN 25 FEET”.
4. Weeds. grass, brush, trash, and other combustible materials shall be kept a minimum

of 10 feet from the tank.

5. A minimum 6A:80BC fire extinguisher shall be provided within 50 feet of the tank. It
shall be the applicant’s responsibility to have the fire extinguisher serviced by a qualified
contractor on an annual basis.

6. During refueling, the LP tank vehicle shall not be left unattended at any time.”

“§ 15.20.300 SECTION 313.3 ADDED - RESPONSIBILITY FOR FIRE.

Section 313.3 is hereby added to the Fire Code to read as follows:

Any person utilizing an internal combustion engine on any grass-covered or brush-covered land
shall be responsible for any emergency and response costs as a result of such use, if the costs
resulted from the person's intentional or careless acts, or if the costs were caused by a defective
or deficient spark arrester. If the person is a juvenile, such person's parent or guardian shall be
responsible for the costs.”

“§ 15.20.310 SECTION 4907 AMENDED - DEFENSIBLE SPACE.
Section 4907 of the Fire Code is hereby amended to read as follows:

4907.1 Objective. Provisions of this section are intended to modify the fuel load in areas
adjacent to structures to create a defensible space within the hazardous fire zone.

4907.2 Fuel modification. Fuel modification shall be provided within a distance from buildings or
structures as specified in Table 49-1. Distances specified in Table 49-1 shall be measured along
the grade from the perimeter or projection of the building or structure.

Persons owning, leasing, controlling, operating, or maintaining buildings or structures requiring
defensible spaces are responsible for modifying or removing non fire-resistive vegetation.
Ornamental vegetative fuel or cultivated ground cover, such as green grass, ivy, succulents or
similar plants used as ground cover, are allowed to be within the designated defensible space
provided they do not form a means of readily transmitting fire from the native growth to any
structure.

Trees are allowed within the defensible space provided that the distances between crowns and
crowns from adjacent trees, structures or unmodified fuel is not less than 15 feet (4572 mm).
Trees shall be maintained free of dead wood and litter.

4907.3 Fences. Fences within 10 feet (3050 mm) of a structure and requiring a permit in
accordance with the Building Code shall be constructed of noncombustible materials where

located-withinthe-defensible-space.

TABLE 49-1
REQUIRED DEFENSIBLE SPACE

Wildland-Urban Interface Area | Fuel Modification Distance (feet)

Moderate hazard 30

High hazard 100

Extreme or very high hazard 200




The hazard rating shall be determined in accordance with N.F.P.A. 299 or legislative action.
For Sl:1 foot = 305 mm

4907 .4 Adjacent landowners. Persons owning, leasing, controlling, operating, or maintaining
land within the defensible space surrounding buildings or structures as described in Table 49-1
shall modify or remove non- fire resistive vegetation from their land as necessary to provide the
required fuel modification. Such persons may satisfy the requirements of this section by
permitting access to their property to persons owning, leasing, controlling, operating or
maintaining the neighboring property that is improved with buildings or structures for the
purpose of modifying or removing non-fire resistive vegetation to provide the appropriate fuel
modification. If such access is provided, persons owning, leasing, controlling, operating or
maintaining the neighboring property that is improved with buildings or structures shall bear the
duty to comply with the requirements of this section.”

“§ 15.20.320 SECTION 4914 4908 ADDED - ACCESS.
Section 4844 4908 is hereby added to the Fire Code to read as follows:

SECTION 44814 4908 ACCESS

49141 4908.1 Objective. The objective of this Section is to establish the minimum requirements
for emergency vehicle access for buildings and structures located in the wildland-urban
interface areas

4944.—2 4908.2 Subdivision Access. New subdivisions, as determined by this jurisdiction, shall
be provided with fire apparatus access roads in accordance with the Fire Code and N.F.P.A.
299 and access requirements in accordance with Section 4844 4908.

4914-2.1 4908.2.1 Individual Structure Access. Individual structures hereafter constructed or
moved into or within wildland-urban interface areas shall be provided with fire apparatus access
in accordance with the Fire Code and N.F.P.A. 299 and driveways in accordance with Section
4914-4 4908.4. Marking of fire-protection equipment shall be provided in accordance with
Section 4914-6 4908.6 and address markers shall be provided in accordance with Section
49147 4908.7.

49142 2 4908.2.2 Existing Conditions. Existing buildings and structures shall be provided with
address markers in accordance with Section 4944-7 4908.7. Existing roads and fire protection
equipment shall be provided with markings in accordance with Sections 4844-5 4908.5 and
49146 4908.6.

4914-3 4908.3 Restricted Access. Where emergency vehicle access is restricted due to secured
access roads or driveways or where immediate access is necessary for life saving or fire
fighting purposes, the code official is authorized to require a key box to be installed in an
accessible location. The key box shall be of a type approved by the code official and shall
contain keys to gain necessary access as required by the code official.

4914-4 4908.4 Driveways. Driveways shall be provided when access is not available at least

within 150 feet (45720mm) from any portion of an exterior wall on grade. Driveways shall
provide a minimum unobstructed width of 12 feet (3658 mm) and a minimum unobstructed
height of 13 feet 6 inches (4115 mm). Driveways in excess of 150 feet (45720 mm) in length
shall be provided with turnarounds. Driveways in excess of 200 feet (60960 mm) in length shall
be provided with turnouts in addition to turnarounds. Driveway lengths shall not exceed one-half




the approved maximum access road length. Vehicle load limits shall be posted at both
entrances to bridges on driveways. See-the-Fire-Gode-for-additional-bridge-requirements:
Bridges shall also comply with CFC 503.2.6. Driveway turnarounds shall cave have an inside
turning radii radius of not less than 30-feet(8144-mm) 28-feet (8540 mm) and outside turning
radii radius of not less than 45-feet-(13716-mm) 48-feet (14640 mm). Driveways which connect
with a road or roads at more than one point may be considered as having a turnaround if all
changes of direction meet the radii requirements for driveway turnarounds.

Driveway turnouts shall be an all-weather road surface at least 10 feet (3048 mm) wide and 30
feet (9144mm) long. Driveway turnouts shall be located as required by the code official.

A driveway shall be defined as vehicular ingress and egress routes that serve no more than two
(2) buildings or structures, not including accessory structures, on one parcel, containing no
more than three (3) dwelling units.

EXCEPTIONS: When topography prevents appropriate fire apparatus access the Fire Chief
may consider additional fire protection systems, build-in fire resistive construction or
supplementary brush abatement measures, or all of the above, in lieu of the minimum standards
established. The Fire Chief or his/her designee shall have discretion on acceptable
requirements which shall not be subject to planning commission review.

4914.5 4908.5 Marking of Roads. Approved signs or other approved notices shall be provided
and maintained for access roads and driveways to identify such roads and prohibit the
obstruction thereof or both. All road identifications signs shall have minimum 4-inch high (102
mm) letters with 1-1/2 inch (13 mm) stroke on a contrasting 6-inch high (153 mm) sign. Road
identification signage shall be mounted at a height of 7 feet (2134 mm) from the road surface to
the bottom of the sign.

4914-6 4908.6 Marking of Fire Protection Equipment. Fire protection equipment and fire
hydrants shall be clearly identified in a manner approved by the code official to prevent
obstruction.

49147 4908.7 Address Markers. All buildings shall have a permanently posted address, which
shall be placed at each driveway entrance and visible from both directions of travel along the
road. In all cases, the address shall be posted at the beginning of construction and shall be
maintained thereafter, and the address shall be visible and legible from the road on which the
address is located. Address signs along one-way roads shall be visible from both the intended
direction of travel and the opposite direction. Where multiple addresses are required at a single
driveway, they shall be mounted on a single post. Where a roadway provides access solely to a
single commercial or industrial business, the address sign shall be placed at the nearest road
intersection providing access to that site.

§ 15.20.330 SECTION 104.11 AMENDED - AUTHORITY AT FIRES AND OTHER
EMERGENCIES.

Section 104.11 is amended to read as follows:

Authority at Fire and Other Emergencies

104.11. General. The Chief or officer of the fire department in charge at the scene of a fire or
other emergency, including such fires and emergencies at industrial facilities where a private fire
brigade or a private fire department is established, involving the protection of life or property or
any part thereof, shall have the authority to direct such operations as necessary to extinguish or
control any fire, perform any rescue operations, investigate the existence of suspected or
reported fires, gas leaks or other hazardous conditions or situations or of taking any action
necessary in the reasonable performance of duty. Command and control of the emergency shall
be the responsibility of the Monrovia Fire Department, with cooperation and technical or




professional input provided by appropriate private sector employees and/or management. In the
exercise of such power, the chief is authorized to prohibit any person, vehicle, vessel, or thing
from approaching the scene and is authorized to remove or cause to be removed or kept away
from the scene any vehicle, vessel or thing which could impede or interfere with the operations
of the fire department and, in the judgment of the chief, any person not actually and usefully
employed in the extinguishing of such fire or in the preservation of property in the vicinity
thereof."

“§ 15.20.335 SECTION 104.11.4 ADDED - FINANCIAL RESPONSIBILITY.

104.11.4 Financial Responsibility. Any person who personally, or through another, willfully,
negligently, or in violation of law, sets a fire, allows a fire to be set, or allows a fire kindled or
attended by him/her to escape from his/her control, allows any hazardous material to be
handled, stored, disposed, of, or transported in a manner not in accordance with this Code,
State law or nationally recognized Standards, allows any hazardous materials to escape from
his/her control, allows continuation of a violation of this Code is liable for the expense of fighting
the fire including fire investigation or for the expenses incurred during a hazardous materials
incident, and such expense will be charged against that person.”

“§ 15.20.340 APPENDIX D AMENDED - FIRE APPARATUS ACCESS ROADS.

Appendix D-- Fire Apparatus Access Roads is amended and added to read in its entirety as
follows:

Appendix D

Fire Apparatus Access Roads

§ D101—GENERAL

D101.1 Scope. The provisions of Chapter 5, Section 683-2-4 503, apply unless specially
modified by this appendix. This appendix is intended to provide guidelines to be considered by
the chief when determining fire department access for commercial and residential developments
when onsite access is required. Approved alternatives for fire department access include the
needs of the local fire department and the following sections.

§ D104—Minimum Specifications
D104.3.4 Multiple Access Provisions. The chief is authorized to require two or more means of

access in accordance with Section 503.1.2

D103.5.1 Access-control Devices. When required fire department access is restricted by the
installation of access-control devices, such devices shall be approved by the chief, provide
adequate clear width for fire department apparatus and be maintained operable at all times.

D103.6 Signs. When motor vehicle parking is allowed on access roadways, such parking shall
not encroach into the fire department access roadway. When this provision is compromised or
restricted, the chief is authorized to require signage to indicate parking restriction in accordance
with Section 503.3.

D102.1-Access-andloading- D103.7 Widths. Access roadways or streets shall comply with the
provisions of Chapter 5, Section 503.2.1. Fire department access shall have an unobstructed
width of not less than 25 20 feet. Road widths shall be as approved by the chief, or as follows:
(1) 25 20 feet wide when parking is not allowed on either side of the roadway,

(2) 28 26 feet wide when parking is not allowed on only one side of the roadway, and




(3) 34 32 feet wide when parking is not restricted.

B403.6-3 D103.2.1 Angles of Approach and Departure. The angles of approach and departure
for any means of access shall not exceed the design limitations of the fire apparatus of the fire
department , or 8 percent, whichever is greater.

“§ 15.20.350 SECTION-504.4-ADDED—PHOTOVOLTAIC SYSTEMS-INSTALLATION
REQUIREMENTS. RESERVED




sponse-to-fires. RESERVED”




“§ 15.20.360 SECTION §40.3 1103.2 AMENDED—EMERGENCY RESPONDER RADIO
COVERAGE IN EXISTING BUILDINGS.

Section 540-3 1103.2 of the California Fire Code is amended to read as follows:

510-3 1103.2 Emergency responder radio coverage in existing buildings. Existing buildings that
do not have approved radio coverage for emergency responders within the building shall be
equipped with such coverage according to one of the following:

1. Wherever an existing wired communication system cannot be repaired or is being replaced,
or where not approved in accordance with Section 510.1, Exception 1.

2. Whenever total additions result in an increase of more than 5000 square feet in the total floor
area, including mezzanines or additional stories, regardless of ownership. Additions shall be
cumulative with each application for building permit from January 1, 2011.”

“§ 15.20.370 VIOLATIONS—APPENDIX K AMENDED - PERMITS

olator. A he-chall ‘shed ingly.
APPENDIX K SECTION K101.2 AMENDED - PERMITS.
Section K101.2 of the California Fire Code is amended to read as follows:
K101.2 Permits. An operational permit shall be required for haunted houses, ghost walks, or
similar amusement uses in accordance with Appendix K101.2.

EXCEPTION: Haunted houses, ghost walks, or similar amusement uses in Group R-3

occupancies.”
“§ 15.20.380 RESRONSIBILITY: VIOLATIONS

VIOLATIONS. Any violation of any provision of this Chapter or any Code adopted herein by

reference shall constitute a misdemeanor and shall be punishable by a fine not to exceed one
thousand dollars ($1.000) or by imprisonment for a period not to exceed six (6) months, or by
both such fine and imprisonment, unless prosecuted as an infraction by the City Prosecutor.




Each and every day such a violation exists shall constitute a separate and distinct violation of
this Ordinance.”

“§ 15.20.390 RESPONSIBILITY.

The expense of each response or any action by the Monrovia Fire Department which is the
result of a violation of the Fire Code, or any damage caused by malicious mischief, or any action
determined to be intentional or negligent requiring any response, assistance, or corrective or
preventative action conducted by Fire Department personnel, shall be a charge against the
responsible person whose violation or action caused the Fire Department response or action.
The expense of such response or action shall constitute a debt of such person and the Fire
Chief shall keep an itemized account of said expenses. The Fire Department shall give notice of
said expenses to such persons and a hearing as to the validity and amount of such charge shall
be conducted before an impartial Hearing Officer within 30 days, if requested in writing within
ten days of the date of such notice. The Hearing Officer's determination shall be final. The city
may take such actions as are reasonable and necessary to recover such expenses from any
and all responsible persons.”

SECTION 3. The City Council hereby finds that each and all of the foregoing
modifications to the Uniform Codes adopted by reference in this Ordinance are reasonably
necessary to protect the health, safety, and general welfare of the residents of the City of
Monrovia due to the local climatic, geological and topographical conditions identified as to each
modification in Exhibit A, attached to this Ordinance and adopted herein by this reference.
Exhibit A shall not be codified, but shall remain a part of the permanent records of the City along
with this Ordinance.

SECTION 4. All inconsistencies between this Ordinance and the various Codes adopted
in this Ordinance are changes, modifications, amendments, additions or deletions thereto
authorized by California Health and Safety Sections 17958.5 and 17958.7.

SECTION 5. To the extent the provisions of this Ordinance are substantially the same
as previous provisions of the Monrovia Municipal Code, these provisions shall be construed as
continuations of those provisions and not as new enactments. Nothing in this Ordinance shall
waive or excuse any violation of law existing as of the date this Ordinance is adopted.

SECTION 6. If any section, subsection, subdivision, paragraph, sentence, clause or
phrase of this Ordinance or any part hereof or exhibit hereto is for any reason held to be invalid,
such invalidity shall not affect the validity of the remaining portions of this Ordinance or any part
thereof or exhibit thereto. The City Council of the City of Monrovia hereby declares that it wouid
have passed each section, subsection, subdivision, paragraph, sentence, clause or phrase
hereof, irrespective of the fact that any one or more sections, subsections, subdivisions,
paragraphs, sentences, clauses or phrases be declared invalid.

SECTION 7. The City Clerk shall certify to the adoption of this Ordinance, post and/or
publish according to applicable law, and shall transmit a certified copy of this Ordinance to the
California Building Standards Commission forthwith.




INTRODUCED this 5th day of November, 2013.
PASSED, APPROVED, AND ADOPTED this 3rd day of December, 2013.

777@%4%;2

/ I\# z, Mayor
Cit rovia

ATTEST: APPROVED AS TO FORM:

Craig A. Stesfte, City Attorney
City of Monrovia

[424 ///%ZLM‘

City of Monrovia

%(Ahce D. Atking, CMC\ Cily Clérk




STATE OF CALIFORNIA )
COUNTY OF LOS ANGELES ) §
CITY OF MONROVIA )

I, RACHAEL A. HUGHES, Deputy City Clerk of the City of Monrovia, California, do
hereby certify that the foregoing is a full, true and correct copy of Ordinance No. 2013-
05; It has been published pursuant to law; was duly adopted and passed at a regular
meeting of the Monrovia City Council on the 3rd day of December, 2013, by the
following vote:

AYES: Counciimembers Adams, Blackburn, Spicer, Mayor Pro Tem Shevlin, Mayor
Lutz

NOES:

ABSTAIN:

ABSENT:

ATTEST:

City of Monrovia




